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Civility Difficult To Find In Aftermath Of Olson’s & 
Wilson’s 2024 Election To The Redlands School Board 

Obernolte’s Authorship & Knowledge Of His Own Land Swap Bill Under Question

Ryan McEachron

at various locations and 
altitudes ranging from 
approximately 5,200 feet 
to 7,000 feet in the San 
Bernardino Mountains 

By Carlos Avalos  and 
Mark Gutglueck

San Bernardino 
County Board of Edu-
cation Member Ryan 
McEachron’s vitriolic 
reaction to county resi-
dents’ public records 
requests has triggered 
alarm among his con-
stituents and a complaint 
to the district attorney’s 
office, as citizen efforts 
to monitor spending 
priorities by regional 

education officials con-
tinue, spurred on by cu-
riosity over the basis of 
McEachron’s animus.

At two separate points 
during the September 
8, 2025 meeting of the 
San Bernardino County 
Board of Education, 
McEachron took excep-
tion to the intensive ex-
amination members of 
the public have in recent 
weeks and months been 
making of the decision-

making engaged in by 
the county board of edu-
cation, San Bernardino 
County Superintendent 
of Schools Ted Alejan-
dre and school boards of 
several districts through-
out the county.

At issue in multiple 
instances is how elected 
educational officials, 
including Alejandre, 
have created or other-
wise participated in ar-
rangements involving 

the expenditure of edu-
cational program funds 
that have profited their 

friends, business or po-
litical associates, family 
members or themselves 
personally. In the same 
timeframe, there have 
been associated revela-
tions demonstrating the 
political interconnec-
tions between the coun-
ty’s elected educational 
officials, consisting pri-
marily of school board 
members and Alejandre 
himself making dona-
tions to one an-

By Anthony Serrano 
and Mark Gutglueck

Congressman Jay 
Obernolte finds himself 
under withering scru-
tiny and, in some cases, 
relentless attack for 
what some of his most 
ardent political support-
ers and members of his 
staff acknowledge was 
his “uninformed” sup-
port for the San Manuel 
Indian Tribe’s swap of 
1,460 acres it has ac-
quired in the San Ber-
nardino National Forest 

for two parcels of federal 
land consisting of 1,475.9 
acres located near the 
Arrowhead Springs Ho-
tel at the approximate 
2,000-foot elevation 
in the San Bernardino 
Mountain foothills.

At issue are the water 
rights that can be con-
strued as being associ-
ated with the lower-lying 
land and the potential 
that the tribe’s future 
diversion of that water 
will severely impact a 
major source of water 

for 450,000 people and 
remaining agricultural 
uses in the greater San 
Bernardino Metropoli-
tan area and the water-
shed along the Santa Ana 
River as it progresses to-
ward the Pacific Ocean, 
which is a primary and 
secondary source of wa-
ter for another 300,000 
Southern California resi-
dents.

Two identical federal 
bills, House Resolution 
3925, sponsored by Con-
gressman Jay Obernolte, 

and Senate Bill 2796, 
sponsored by Senator 
Alex Padilla and Senator 
Adam Schiff, are intend-
ed to effectuate the Yu-
haaviatam of San Manu-
el Nation Land Exchange 
Act, which facilitates 
the land swap between 
the U.S. Forest Service 
and the Yuhaaviatam of 
the San Manuel Nation. 
The stated purpose of 
the proposed legislation, 
placing the 1,475.9 acres 
of federal property into 
the hands of the 

By John Berry
Never in my two de-

cades in the newspaper 
business have I ever seen 
elected officials so vi-
ciously attacked as three 
members of the Red-
lands school board.

I don’t say that lightly. 
In my reporting days in 
Florida and California, 
I’ve covered multiple 
levels of elected officials, 
from fire and community 

college district trustees 
to county commissioners 
and state legislators.

A group calling itself 
Together For Redlands 
spearheads vicious and 
vile attacks on Redlands 
Unified School District 
board members Candy 
Olson, Jeannette Wilson, 
and Michele Rendler. 
At meetings, needlessly 
lasting past midnight, 
numerous Together For 

Redlands supporters 
would typically call the 
trio “Nazis,” “fascists” 
and “white Christian na-
tionalists.”

And that’s just for 
starters. Often, attack-
ers – including current 
and former Redlands 
students – would flip 
middle fingers and drop 
F-bombs as well as 
scream primal profan-
ity at the board. 

The prospect that 
American Medical Re-
sponse can hang on to the 
virtual monopoly it has 
enjoyed as the dominant 
provider of ambulance 
service in geographi-
cally expansive San Ber-
nardino County over the 
last two decades has nar-
rowed significantly over 
the last several months. 
Indeed, it appears that 
the company may soon 
be  driven out of busi-
ness in this neck of the 
woods entirely.

The powers that be in 
the regional, county and 
municipal governmental 
structure were once so 
enamored with Ameri-
can Medical Response 
that they conferred fa-
vored status upon the 
company, which is 
known by the  initialism 
AMR. Those fickle poli-
ticians, however, have 
now taken up with a con-
sortium of governmen-
tal agencies and its se-
lected corporate partner 
to create a quasi-public, 
quasi-private emergency 
medical transportation 
program that is being 
touted as the wave of the 
future.

More than a year-and-
a-half ago, the San Ber-
nardino County Board of 
Supervisors moved vig-
orously to end AMR’s 
ambulance service fran-
chise. - AMR’s corporate 
officers felt the county 
had done so a little too 
spiritedly and responded 
by suing San Bernardino 
County in both state and 
federal court.

Rulings made this 
year in the federal court 
case and  the reaction 
to those rulings by the 
judge hearing the matter 
in state court do 

In a rare demonstra-
tion of division between 
two of California’s oth-
erwise closely-aligned 
Democrats, Governor 
Gavin Newsom on Octo-
ber 1 vetoed State Sena-
tor Sabrina Cervantes’ 
bill aimed at limiting 
the use and retention of 
information gleaned by 
license plate readers.

A license plate reader, 
variously known as an 

automated license plate 
recognition system and 
their respective acro-
nyms LPR and ALPR, 
consists of a camera and 
accompanying software 
used to automatically 
capture photos of ve-
hicle license plates. The 
accompanying software 
system, which is coor-
dinated to link up with 
various data storage and 
processing banks 

A governmental de-
cision made halfway 
around the globe yes-
terday has brightened 
immeasurably the pros-
pects that a San Ber-
nardino County mining 
operation will recapture 
its former glory.

The unincorporated 
community of Mountain 
Pass in San Bernardino 
County’s extreme north-
east corner is host to 
what was in the 1950s, 

1960s, 1970s and 1980s 
the world’s most produc-
tive rare earth element 
mine. Rare earth metals, 
also referred to as lan-
thanides, are a set of 17 
minerals – specifically 
scandium, yttrium, lan-
thanum, cerium, praseo-
dymium, neodymium, 
promethium, samarium, 
gadolinium, europium, 
terbium, dysprosium, 
holmium, erbium, thu-
lium, lutetium and yt-

terbium. They serve as 
niche ingredients in the 
components of high-
tech devices, including 
mercury-vapor lamps, 
high-temperature su-
perconductors, lasers, 
microwave filters, high 
refractive index glass, 
electrical vehicles, flint 
products, battery-elec-
trodes, camera lenses, 
carbon arc lighting, di-
dymium glass used in 
welding goggles, ce-

ramic capacitors, nuclear 
batteries, specialized 
magnets, semi-conduc-
tors, red and blue phos-
phors, x-ray machines, 
infrared lasers and com-
puter chips.

The mine was closed 
down in the 1990s be-
cause of environmen-
tal concerns. During its 
hiatus, the Chinese leapt 
into the breach and be-
came the owners and 
operators of mines pro-

ducing in excess of 80 
percent of the world’s 
rare earth elements. In 
the same timeframe, 
over the last three de-
cades, with scientific ad-
vancements, rare earths 
became more and more 
crucial to the economy 
as modern products in-
creasingly utilized com-
ponents containing lan-
thanides.

After the turn of the 
m i l l e n n i u m , 
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others’ electioneering 
funds.

McEachron found 
himself provoked in the 
early stage of the meet-
ing, after the preliminary 
and ceremonial items 
were dealt with and the 
board was hearing pub-
lic comments. A former 
instructor with the Eti-
wanda School District, 
Antoinette Jensen, made 
some critical observa-
tions with regard to the 
county’s educational 
establishment, includ-
ing the assertion that the 
county superintendent 
of schools office had en-
gaged in “pay-to-play” 
practices with regard 
to contracting, a nepo-
tistic arrangement in 
which Alejandre’s wife 
had been provided with 
a contract exceeding 
$200,000 per year and 
other conflict-of-interest 
entanglements. Jensen 
referenced the funnel-
ing of campaign money 
to and between elected 

educational position 
candidates with whom 
Alejandre or board 
members are aligned 
and concerted efforts to 
remove individuals in 
office who are not in line 
policy-wise or politically 
with the prime movers in 
the county’s educational 
establishment. “Inde-
pendent voices get in the 
way of your power,” Jen-
sen asserted.

Jensen accused the 
county educational office 
of delaying responses to 
public records requests.

Mark Butler advo-
cated that the board 
commission an inde-
pendent outside audi-
tor to look at the county 
superintendent’s office’s 
budget. With regard to 
the board making a col-
lective response to an 
email communication 
dated August 22, 2025 
from Deputy San Ber-
nardino County Counsel 
Richard Luczak, Butler 
recommended that the 
individual members of 
the board retain sepa-
rate lawyers to represent 
them rather than having 
one attorney for all five 
members collectively. 
His suggestion was that 
some board members 
were entangled in mis-
feasance or malfeasance 
while others were not.

McEachron refer-
enced a letter he had 
received from the Cali-
fornia Fair Political 
Practices Commission 
which he said noted that 
he had been cleared of 
any wrongdoing relat-
ing to political donations 
that had passed between 
his and Alejandre’s po-
litical war chests.

“Basically, the gist of 
the letter says that there 
was no validation to 
the complaint brought 
against me,” McEachron 
said. He identified Jen-
sen as having made the 
request for the Fair Po-
litical Practices Com-
mission investigation, 
and he chastised her for 
not having mentioned 
the FPPC’s finding dur-
ing her comments. He 
went on to note that 
“There is another com-
plaint out there similar 
in nature against me. I 
expect the FPPC [Fair 
Political Practices Com-
mission] will find in 
the same way, that I did 
nothing wrong in mak-
ing a contribution to Mr. 
Alejandre’s reelection 
campaign.”

McEachron evinced 
pique at the manner in 
which members of the 
public were highlight-
ing official action they 
disagreed with and were 

making use of govern-
mental oversight agen-
cies that directly involve 
citizen input or are actu-
ated by citizen inquiries 
or complaints, such as 
the California Fair Po-
litical Practices Com-
mission.

“The thing that con-
cerns me so much about 
these complaints is how 
similar they are in na-
ture,” McEachron said. 
“It would speak to there’s 
a lot of collaboration, 
coordination and collu-
sion going on amongst 
members of the public to 
come after members of 
this board.”

While McEachron 
spoke somewhat ellip-
tically and indirectly, 
he came across as par-
ticularly sensitive about 
recently surfaced rev-
elations and follow-up 
charges of cronyism and 
nepotism against sev-
eral of San Bernardino 
County’s elected public 
education officials. Some 
of those pertain to favor-
able treatment school 
districts, the county 
board of education and 
the county superin-
tendent’s office have 
shown to campaign do-
nors, associates, friends 
and family members of 
school board members 
or those of Alejandre by 

extending to them vend-
ing or service contracts 
as well as consultancies 
and employment.

McEachron suggest-
ed that while members 
of the public had a cer-
tain degree of license in 
criticizing and examin-
ing public officials with 
regard to their com-
portment in office, that 
privilege did not extend 
to them when they were 
finding fault with indi-
viduals or companies 
doing business with the 
district. Those entities, 
McEachron maintained, 
would not qualify as 
public figures or even 
limited purpose public 
figures under slander 
and libel law, and were 

thus immune from in-
quiry or criticism.

“It’s one thing to 
come after a public offi-
cial, but when you start 
invoking members of the 
private sector or their 
corporations – one of the 
speakers said something 
about ‘You all need to 
get your own attorneys’ 
– well, I would suggest 
the same for you, be-
cause you are bringing 
on liability against your-
self when you’re going 
after private citizens or 
private corporations that 
you do not know, and 
you cannot do that. It is 
not legal.”

Without citing any 
civil or criminal statures 

not bode well for Ameri-
can Medical Response, 
as those in the know and 
interested parties now 
appear to be preparing 
for AMR’s  near-monop-
oly to be handed over to 
the consortium.,

Somewhat ironically, 
despite American Medi-
cal Response having 
previously enjoyed a 
quasi-monopoly in San 
Bernardino County by 
virtue of having secured 
exclusive operating fran-
chises across a wide 
swath of the region, its 
lawyers had argued that 
the county governmen-
tal structure controlling 
those franchises was il-
legally a monopolistic 
system. Judge Kenly 
Kato, who is hearing the 
matter in federal court, 
ruled  the anti-trust 

principle cited by the 
law firm representing 
American Medical Re-
sponse in the federal suit 
is inapplicable. Earlier 
this year a panel of three 
judges with the U.S, 
Ninth Circuit Court of 
Appeals – consisting of  
Justices Consuelo Calla-
han, Roopali Desai, and 
Ana De Alba – upheld 
Judge Kato

 . As a result, the le-
gal challenge to San 
Bernardino County’s 
December 2023 decision 
to confer a franchise for 
emergency medical re-
sponse throughout most 
of the county’s desert 
region on Consolidated 
Fire Agencies – other-
wise known as CON-
FIRE – resides now in 
San Bernardino Superior 
Court under the scrutiny 
of Superior Court Judge 
Jay Robinson.

The matter is fraught 
with substantial politi-
cal considerations. It ex-
tends even beyond the 
huge geographical con-
fines of San Bernardino 

County to cover the en-
tirety of both Inyo and 
Mono counties and will 
potentially have a huge 
impact on the bottom 
line of two out-of-state 
corporations, one based 
in Colorado and another 
in Arizona.

At the heart of the dis-
pute is the Inland Coun-
ties Emergency Manage-
ment Agency, known by 
its acronym   ICEMA, 
a joint powers agency 
formed in 1975 by San 
Bernardino, Inyo and 
Mono counties to   coor-
dinate emergency medi-
cal response by planning, 
implementing and evalu-
ating an effective emer-
gency medical services 
(EMS) system including 
fire departments, public 
ambulances, prehospital 
providers, hospitals, and 
specialty hospitals, such 
as trauma, stroke and 
cardiac care providers.

Faced with the logisti-
cal difficulty of coordi-
nating various services 
across a 33,467-square 
mile area, officials in 

both Inyo and Mono 
counties designated the 
San Bernardino County 
Board of Supervisors to 
serve as the governing 
board for ICEMA.

ICEMA oversees is-
sues pertaining to emer-
gency medical response  
within the 33,464 
square mile expanse of 
20,105-square mile San 
Bernardino County, 
10,227-square mile Inyo 
and 3,132-square mile 
Mono County, a com-
bined area that is larger 
than 12 different states, 
including Maine, South 
Carolina, West Virgin-
ia, Maryland, Vermont, 
New Hampshire, Mas-
sachusetts, New Jersey, 
Hawaii, Connecticut, 
Delaware and Rhode 
Island separately and 
larger than Vermont, 
New Hampshire, Massa-
chusetts and New Jersey 
combined.

There are within all 
three of those counties 
extensive areas that are 
only sparsely populated 
but still need emergency 

medical response from 
time to time. To ensure 
that the emergency re-
sponse needs of these 
areas would be met, 
ICEMA decreed that 
each such area would be 
served by a single am-
bulance company autho-
rized to be the exclusive 
provider of emergency 
medical transportation 
in that zone, in effect 
granting the ambulance 
company a monopoly in 
the area. The ostensible 
rationale for granting 
these monopolies is that 
operating ambulances 
is an expensive proposi-
tion, not to mention one 
that is crucial to public 
health and safety. Com-
petition between am-
bulance companies has 
the potential, so the rea-
soning goes, of driving 
down the prices those 
companies charge to the 
point that their opera-
tions would not be prof-
itable enough for them 
to remain in business. If 
these ambulance com-
panies were to go out of 

business,  there would be 
insufficient emergency 
medical transportation 
service available to en-
sure public safety. It was 
for this reason that those 
monopolistic arrange-
ments – the exclusive 
operating zones – were 
first established.

In years past, prior to 
the founding of ICEMA 
in 1975, such exclusive 
operating zones did not 
exist in San Bernardino 
County, and there was 
widespread, indeed cut-
throat competition be-
tween ambulance opera-
tors. In what was then the 
most heavily populated 
area of San Bernardino 
County – the east and 
west valleys extending 
from Redlands and Men-
tone in the east to Chino 
and Montclair in the west 
in the late 1960s and into 
the 1970s, four relatively 
young men in their late 
20s and early 30s – Terry 
Russ, Homer Aerts, Don 
Reed and Steve Dick-

ICEMA Was 
Formed To Coor-
dinate Regional 
Emergency Re-
sponse   from front 
page  
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Senators & Con-
gressman Did Not 
Look Closely At 
The H2O Implica-
tion Of The Land 
Swap With The 

tribe in exchange for title 
on 1,460 acres of fee land 
now owned by the tribe 
being transferred to the 
federal government, is, 
ostensibly, to assist the 
Yuhaaviatam Nation im-
prove management of its 
reservation, protect cul-

tural sites, and enhance 
wildfire prevention.

At least since 2017, 
the tribe, which consists 
of between 180 and 200 
members, has had de-
signs on the land sur-
rounding the historic Ar-
rowhead Springs Hotel. 
The tribe has acquired 
the hotel, which is situ-
ated in the foothills about 
four miles as the crow 
flies in a northwesterly 
direction from the San 
Manuel Reservation, lo-
cated in Highland. Ac-

cording to the Yuhaavia-
tam Nation, members of 
which have become fab-
ulously wealthy as a con-
sequence of the 290,000 
square-foot gaming 
space Yaamava’ Ca-
sino and accompanying 
17-story, 432-room hotel 
tower resort, it has run 
out of space to construct 
millennial mansions for 
the tribe’s youngest gen-
eration, and for that rea-
son needed to acquire the 
land in the foothills.

While Padilla, Schiff 

and Obernolte took the 
tribe and its representa-
tives at their word that 
the motivation for the 
land acquisition was ba-
sically to obtain property 
which the tribe could 
develop residentially, 
others were more mind-
ful of the implication the 
tribe’s acquisition of the 
land will have in terms 
of its strategic location 
vis-à-vis the local and re-
gional water supply.

There was a water sup-
ply relationship between 

Nestlé Waters of North 
America, the former bot-
tler of Arrowhead Moun-
tain Spring Water, which 
between 1987 and 2021 
utilized water drafted 
from Strawberry Can-
yon, utilizing adits and 
horizontal borehole wells 
at many of the natural 
springs near the headwa-
ters of Strawberry Creek 
at an elevation between 
5,200 and 5,600 feet 
in the San Bernardino 
Mountains. Nestlé con-
veyed the water from 

Strawberry Creek down 
the mountainside in a 
pipeline that terminated 
on property near the Ar-
rowhead Springs Hotel, 
a facility where that wa-
ter was transferred onto 
trucks to be delivered to 
the Arrowhead Moun-
tain Spring Water bot-
tling plant. Nestlé had a 
water-sharing arrange-
ment with the tribe.

In 2021, Nestlé Wa-
ters of North America 
divested itself of all of 

Police escorted the worst 
out of the meeting. The 
protesters were undaunt-
ed. They picketed and 
leafleted Rendler at her 
church.

Further, the Ark 
Church in Redlands – 
the members of which 
and pastor actively sup-
port Olson and Wilson 
– was singled out for 
vitriol.

Violence and van-

dalism targeting the 
church and its members 
are nothing new. The 
latest attack took place 
in April when, after a 
particularly contentious 
school board meeting, 
swastikas suddenly ap-
peared on Ark Church 
signage. Local, regional, 
state and national media 
covered the crime and 
the FBI questioned sus-
pects. No arrests were 

made, but vandalism has 
since ceased.

Olson, a married 
mother of five, was To-

gether’s prime target. 
Supporters attacked her 
nursing license as well as 
her employer. One foul-

To push its messag-
ing, Together For Red-
lands supporters arrived 
with preprinted signs 

board room as well as 
populating waiting lines 
dozens of people long. 
They vastly outnum-
bered Olson and Wilson 
supporters or those of no 
particular political stripe 
who had come merely to 
watch the meetings.

Together For Red-
lands members might 
have curtailed their be-
havior had the local news 
media reported heated 
meetings accurately. In-
stead, reporters glossed 
over Together’s behavior 

utilized by law enforce-
ment and other agencies, 
converts the images to 
electronic text, which 
then can be compared 
with or matched to li-
cense plate numbers reg-
istered with the Califor-
nia Department of Motor 
Vehicles or the vehicle 
registrations gleaned 
from other states’ infor-
mation banks.

The readers, mounted 
on poles along roadsides 
or at intersections, gener-
ally make a recording of 
the plate number, date, 
time, and location of the 
vehicle bearing the plate.

Police agencies have 
applied the information 
in multiple contexts to 
identify stolen vehicles or 
track the whereabouts of 
individuals known or sus-
pected to have engaged in 
criminal activity.

While the devices 
have proven of substan-
tial value in document-
ing certain crimes, locat-
ing suspects and stolen 
vehicles, providing evi-
dence that has been used 
in obtaining convictions, 
the data collected by 
an ALPR is routinely 

stored and provides a 
comprehensive record of 
vehicle movements and 
the whereabouts of the 
state’s citizens, the vast 
majority of whom are 
not involved in criminal 
activity.

Civil libertarians had 
concerns that the lack of 
regulation with regard 
to the use of the systems 
and the data they provid-
ed could be an intrusion 
into the privacy of citi-
zens and that it could be 
used for untoward pur-
poses unrelated to legiti-
mate law enforcement ef-
forts. Over the years that 
the readers have been in 
use, some agencies or 
employees of some agen-
cies have shared the im-
ages captured with other 
entities, there was no ef-
fort to keep track of who 
had access to the data, no 
monitoring of the system 
use was in place, there 
were no uniform stan-
dards from agency to 
agency with regard to the 
systems’ and data’s use, 
there were no specific 
restrictions on the sale of 
the data and no plans for 
the erasure of the data or 

the time limits on main-
taining it.

Moreover, among the 
state’s Democratic poli-
ticians opposed to the 
aggressive illegal alien 
deportation policy of the 
Donald Trump Admin-
istration there was con-
cern that the data was or 
could be passed along to 
the Department of Immi-
gration and Customs En-
forcement to collar those 
in the country illegally.

Cervantes introduced 
the legislation, Senate 
Bill 274, which called 
for agencies using the 
automated license plate 
readers to intensify safe-
guards pertaining to em-
ployee access and use of 
the systems. The legis-
lation, if passed, would 
have required law en-
forcement commanders 
overseeing the employ-
ment of the equipment 
be sensitized to the civil 
liberties issues inherent 
in that use, mandated that 
annual audits be carried 
out by the Department 
of Justice with regard to 
their use and placed re-
tention limits on ALPR 
data of 60 days, with 
exceptions that included 
license plate data from 
known stolen vehicles, 
data tied to vehicles in-
volved in suspected crim-

inal activity and data re-
lating to cars on toll roads 
being preserved.

Cervantes argued 
that license plate readers 
represented “a powerful 
surveillance technology 
that can invade the pri-
vacy of all individuals 
and violate the rights of 
entire communities.” She 
said the collected “data 
can form an intimate pic-
ture of a driver’s activi-
ties and even deter First 
Amendment-protected 
activities. This kind of 
targeted tracking threat-
ens to chill fundamental 
freedoms of speech.”

Predictably, the Cali-
fornia Public Defenders 
Association and Surveil-
lance Technology Over-
sight Project supported 
Cervantes’ bill, while the 
California Police Chiefs 
Association and police 
unions across the state 
were opposed to it.

In vetoing SB 274, 
which in September 
passed in the Assembly 
by a vote of 41-to-29 and 
in the Senate 28-to-6, 
Governor Newsom said, 
“I appreciate the author’s 
intent to prevent infor-
mation regarding a per-
son’s whereabouts from 
falling into the wrong 
hands. Nevertheless, 
this measure does not 

strike the delicate bal-
ance between protecting 
individual privacy and 
ensuring public safety. 
For example, it may not 
be apparent, particular-
ly with respect to cold 
cases, that license plate 
data is needed to solve a 
crime until after the 60-
day retention period has 
elapsed. Conversely, re-
strictions on inter-agency 
data sharing may impair 
solving crimes in real 

time, such as highway 
shootings, where the 
suspect may be rapidly 
crossing jurisdictional 
boundaries. Further, by 
restricting law enforce-
ment agencies’ use of 
ALPR information only 
for locating persons or 
vehicles suspected of in-
volvement in crimes, this 
bill would prevent the 
use of this information to 
locate missing persons.”

-Mark Gutglueck

Greenwood Village, Col-
orado-based Molycorp, 
Inc acquired the mine 
and reopened it in 2012, 
for more than two years 
tapping into Mountain 
Pass’s rich deposits. See-
ing that the United States 
was once again on an arc 
toward rare earth inde-
pendence, Chinese com-
panies, subsidized by 
the Communist Chinese 
government, increased 
the output of their mines 
and created a glut of 
rare earths on the world 
market, driving prices 
downward. By 2015, 
Molycorp was unable to 
sell its product at a price 
that matched or exceed-
ed its production costs 

nor defray the interest 
let alone the principal on 
the debt it had taken on 
in the modernization of 
the mine and purchasing 
its accompanying pro-
cessing equipment. Mo-
lycorp declared bank-
ruptcy, and in July 2017, 
the mine and its equip-
ment were acquired by a 
Chinese-led consortium.

The mine remained 
shuttered as the Chinese 
solidified their domi-
nance of the worldwide 
rare earth production in-
dustry. Despite the con-
sideration that the Moun-
tain Pass Mine during 
this time was not pro-
ducing a profit, in moves 
that were motivated, per-
haps, as much or more 
by patriotic sentiment 
than mercenary intent, 

Rare Earth Mine 
Raring To Go   
from front page 

Tribe from front page 

Candy Olson

mouthed youngster said 
Olson’s mother “should 
have had an abortion.”

The goal of Together 
appears to be intimidat-
ing and bullying, wheth-
er in person or via social 
media, the trio and their 
supporters into acqui-
escing to politically un-
popular positions such 
as promoting transgen-
derism among students, 
pushing sexually explicit 
material into district li-
braries, and flying ho-
mosexual pride flags in 
classrooms.

Jeannette Wilson 

and coordinated attack 
themes. Its members and 
acolytes filled the school 
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that prohibit or outlaw 
inquiries with regard 
to or critical examina-
tion/assessments of gov-
ernmental contractors, 
McEachron offered citi-
zens who are monitor-
ing the San Bernardino 
County Board of Educa-
tion and the county su-
perintendent of schools 
some advice.

“This is a caution to 
be very careful in what 
you’re doing, because 
there is not only civil 
penalties but criminal 
penalties for what you 
are doing,” McEachron 
said. “It’s fine to bring 
accusations against me 
as an elected official. 
This is not my first ro-
deo. I was on the Victor-
ville City Council. I had 
numerous things brought 
against me there. I will 
survive these just as I 
survived those.”

McEachron then 
broadened those within 
the scope of his admon-
ishment from members 
of the public and/or par-
ents of students to other 
elected officials, more 
specifically his col-
leagues on the county 
board of education and 
more narrowly still, An-
drea De Leon and espe-
cially Rita Fernandez-
Loof, whom he indicated 
he suspected were assist-
ing members of the pub-
lic making inquiries.

“What worries me is 
there could be some col-
lusion or collaboration 
going on with members 
of this dais,” McEachron 

said. “I hope and pray 
that is not the case, be-
cause if any of us up here 
collude with members of 
the public to come back 
against this agency, not 
only are you bringing 
the possibility of liabil-
ity against this agency 
but possibility of liabil-
ity against yourself.”

Interfering with com-
panies that have con-
tracts to provide goods 
or services to the board 
of education, the coun-
ty superintendent of 
schools or the county’s 
various school districts 
would have dire con-
sequences for those 
making such inquiries 
or challenges and the 
county school board 
members assisting them, 
McEachron said. “Those 
private citizens, those 
corporations out there, 
they don’t care,” he said. 
“We could spend tens of 
millions of dollars de-
fending your actions be-
cause you colluded with 
a member of the public 
to bring accusations 
against an organization 
or a person that is not 
an elected official. They 
are a private citizen or a 
private corporation. It’s 
a warning of sorts, not 
that I can do anything to 
you. There are others out 
there who can.”

Later that evening, to-
ward the end of the meet-
ing, during that portion 
of the proceedings in 
which the board mem-
bers propose items to be 
placed on the agenda for 
discussion or consider-
ation at future meetings, 
McEachron proposed 
turning the tables on 
those members of the 
public who were scruti-

nizing the board’s action 
or that of the superinten-
dent of county schools 
by tracking the public’s 
use of the California 
Public Records Act to 
obtain information and 
tallying the amount of 
money expended by the 
county superintendent 
of schools office’s staff 
and the county school 
board’s staffs in respond-
ing to the information 
requests.

The California Public 
Records Act, enacted in 
1968, provides the public 
with the right to access 
information concerning 
the conduct of govern-
ment business. The act 
mandates that all public 
records are open to in-
spection unless there is 
a specific exemption to 
a particular record by 
law. Public agencies are 
permitted under the act 
to omit or redact infor-
mation considered con-
fidential or that might 
constitute an invasion 
of privacy if revealed, 
as strictly defined. The 
act specifies a process 
by which those seeking 
records must make re-
quests for the records, 
documents, materials, 
information or data in 
question in ways that 
clearly specify what is 
being sought and in a 
manner that is not overly 
broad or open-ended. 
The act specifies that the 
agency must respond to 
the individual making 
the request within 10 
business days or other-
wise extend the response 
time to a period within 
which it is reasonable to 
find and produce the re-
cords, that the records be 
provided in the format in 

which they are kept and 
that the agency provide 
a cogent reason falling 
within the exceptions 
specified in the act if it 
denies a request.

Referencing members 
of the public in general 
and Jensen specifically 
making such requests, 
McEachron asked his 
board colleagues to go 
along with having Rich-
ard G. De Nava, who 
is the assistant super-
intendent for business 
services in the San Ber-
nardino County Office 
of Education and Ale-
jandre’s right-hand man, 
track the public records 
request that are coming 
into the county’s public 
education division staff 
and tally the costs accru-
ing as a result.

“Mr. De Nava, I’d 
like you to put together 
a running calculator of 
how much staff is spend-
ing on public records 
requests, like mone-
tarily how much we are 
spending,” McEachron 
said. “We are getting 
inundated with these on 
a daily basis, it seems 
like. I think there’s some 
agenda out there, some 
group that’s focused on, 
for some reason, coming 
after us. But, I think it’s 
important that the public 
not only know whatever 
they’re requesting to find 
out but the public also 
know how much money 
– taxpayer money – is 
being expended to pro-
vide them with that in-
formation because it’s 
getting ridiculous. So, 
I would like a running 
calculator, much like 
our debt clock at the fed-
eral level, because this 
is going to continue to 

happen and I want the 
public to see what’s go-
ing on and how much it’s 
costing us to respond to 
these PRAs [Public Re-
cord Act information re-
quests] that come in on a 
daily basis.”

In his comments, 
McEachron assiduously 
avoided mention of the 
substance or subject 
matter at least some of 
the members of the pub-
lic are seeking in mak-
ing the public records 
request, that being infor-
mation showing if elect-
ed education officials 
such as himself or Ale-
jandre have a financial 
interest in business being 
transacted by the coun-
ty’s school districts, the 
county school board, the 
county superintendent 
of schools or his office. 
Instead, McEachron’s 
comments pertained to 
what he referred to as 
the “cost” of having staff 
members devote time 
from their schedules to 
find the sought-after re-
cords and in some cases 
redact them or have them 
reviewed by the school 
board’s legal team or the 
lawyer employed by the 
county superintendent of 
schools to ascertain if the 
documents contain any 
confidential information 
that should be excised, 
expurgated or redacted 
from the documents or 
would justify withhold-
ing them in their en-
tirety. He implied that 
the cost of having such 
reviews made was the 
fault of those making the 
requests.

“This is costing us 
tens of thousands of dol-
lars in taxpayer dollars, 
actually, and I’m not sure 

what the point is, other 
than to make us all look 
bad,” McEachron said. 
He then suggested that 
when the public learns 
of the cost associated 
with producing the doc-
uments, the public will 
grow angry not with the 
officeholders but those 
keeping tabs on them.

“If you want to make 
us look bad, I’m going 
to make them look bad 
back to the taxpayers,” 
McEachron said. “They 
are expending taxpayer 
money doing this, for 
what reason, to what 
end, is my question. 
They probably won’t an-
swer that because they 
don’t want to admit all 
they are doing is trying 
to make us look bad. But 
at the end of the day I 
want the taxpayers of 
San Bernardino County 
to know what is happen-
ing and where their tax 
money is going.”

Board President 
Gwen Dowdy-Rodgers 
and Board Member 
Laura Abernathy Man-
cha came across as sup-
portive of at least some 
of McEachron’s senti-
ments, with Dowdy-
Rodgers echoing what 
he said by suggesting 
that De Nava expand the 
monetary calculations 
of the California Public 
Records request costs 
to include the legal fees 
incurred by the district 
in complying with the 
informational provision 
requirements of the act.

There were aspects 
to the manner in which 
McEachron addressed 
the issue relating to the 
public records requests, 
his objection to them, 

McEachron Ner-
vous About Where 
Public’s Inquiries 
Might Lead   from 
page 2 
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its water holdings in the 
United States and Can-
ada, with the exception 
of its Perrier bottling 
operation, selling them 
to BlueTriton Brands for 
$4.3 billion. Well prior 
to BlueTriton’s acquisi-
tion of Nestlé’s Western 
Hemisphere water as-
sets and by extension 
the Arrowhead Springs 
Mountain Water bot-
tling operation, Nestlé’s 
extraction of water from 
Strawberry Creek had 
been challenged by envi-
ronmentalists, who had 
made appeals to both 
federal officials with the 
U.S. Forest Service and 
the California Depart-
ment of Water Resources 
to intervene and use their 
authority to end Nestlé’s 
water diversions and re-
water the creek.

In December 2017, the 
California State Water 
Resources Control Board 
arrived at a tentative de-
termination that Nestlé 
had the right to divert 
up to 26 acre-feet of wa-
ter (8.47 million gallons) 
per year from Straw-
berry Canyon, while si-
multaneously reporting 
that Nestlé had gone far 
beyond the water draft-
ing limit the company 
was entitled to, and was 
actually drafting 192 
acre-feet (62.56 million 
gallons), such that 166 
acre-feet (54.09 million 
gallons) the company 
was taking per year was 
unauthorized. Despite 
the state water authori-
ties’ determination and 
order, Nestlé continued 
with its historical Straw-
berry Creek water use 
pattern, drafting over 
180-acre-feet of water 
in each of the following 
four years, asserting that 
it had a water use per-
mit issued by the United 
States Forest Service, 
for which it paid a $524 
fee annually, entitling 
the company to uninhib-
ited water use from the 
canyon. Meanwhile, the 
environmentalists’ legal 
and administrative chal-
lenges of Nestlé’s water 
use continued.

Just days after Blu-
eTriton had taken the 
Arrowhead Mountain 
Spring Water bottling op-

eration over from Nestlé, 
the California Water Re-
sources Board reiterated 
its 2017 findings with re-
gard to Nestlé’s excessive 
use of water from Straw-
berry Creek and issued 
a draft cease and desist 
order with regard to all 
of the water diversions 
out of Strawberry Can-
yon. Indeed, the action 
by the state water board 
followed so quickly af-
ter BlueTriton Brands’ 
acquisition of the Arr-
rowhead Spring Water 
bottling operation that 
the cease-and-desist or-
der was issued to Nestlé 
rather than BlueTriton. 
Once BlueTriton Brands 
learned of the order, its 
legal representatives 
swung into action and 
filed both procedural and 
legal challenges to it.

In response, the State 
Water Board suspended 
the order and called for 
what would ultimately 
turn out to be a protract-
ed public hearing on the 
matter that was officiated 
over by an administrative 
hearing officer, Alan Lil-
ly, which took place over 
16 days between January 
2022 through May 2022.

Based upon the infor-
mation provided to him 
by more than two dozen 
expert witnesses called 
by both BlueTriton and 
the California Water Re-
sources Control Board 
during the course of the 
hearings, and after taking 
more than a year to carry 
out a thorough analysis 
of that testimony and 
supporting documenta-
tion, Lilly on July 7, 2023 
sustained the state’s ac-
tion. He concluded that 
BlueTriton does not, and 
formerly Nestlé Waters 
of North America did 
not, hold water rights in 
the forest with regard to 
the water it was extract-
ing through ten sources 
of water in Strawberry 
Canyon, those being tun-
nels 2, 3 and 7, and bore-
holes 1, 1A, 7, 7A, 7B, 7C 
and 8 that became the fo-
cus of the 2022 hearing.

He put his imprimatur 
on a proposed finalized 
cease and desist order 
curtailing the company’s 
diversion of water from 
the Strawberry Creek 

headwater springs.
At its September 19, 

2023 meeting, the State 
Water Resources Control 
Board officially adopted 
Lilly’s findings and ap-
proved the finalized 
cease and desist order.

In July 2024, US 
Forest Service District 
Ranger Michael Nobles 
ordered BlueTriton to 
“cease operations” in the 
San Bernardino National 
Forest and submit a plan 
for removing all its pipes 
and equipment from 
Strawberry Creek.

BlueTriton filed a legal 
action against the State 
of California, contesting 
the legality of the Cali-
fornia Water Resources 
Control Board’s cease-
and-desist order. The 
state and federal action 
relating to ending Blu-
eTriton’s water diversion 
out of Strawberry Can-
yon was stayed as a re-
sult of that litigation.

A more than three-
mile pipeline extends 
in a relatively straight 
line down the mountain-
side from the bottom of 
Strawberry Canyon at 
the approximate 5,000-
foot elevation to a reser-
voir near the Arrowhead 
Springs hotel. Both Blu-
eTriton and the San Man-
uel Tribe utilize the wa-
ter from that reservoir.

The San Manuel Band 
of Mission Indians do not 
have any legal diversion 
order issued by the Cali-
fornia Water Resources 
Board to move Strawber-
ry Creek water through 
that pipeline to the res-
ervoir on its Arrowhead 
Springs Hotel property. 
Federal officials with the 
San Bernardino National 
Forest at this point have 
the sole authority to stop 
the flow of Strawberry 
Creek water via that pipe-
line to the lower altitude. 
The sole recompense to 
the federal government 
for that water being tak-
en out of the forest in a 
quantity ranging to as 
high as 192 acre-feet or 
62.56 million gallons per 
year is the $524 permit 
fee paid by BlueTriton. 
The tribe is not paying 
for any of the water it is 
illegally diverting.

The Bunker Hill Ba-
sin involves a water table 
which underlies a 92 
square mile surface area 
in the San Bernardino 
Valley from which local 

agricultural operations 
as well as domestic us-
ers in the cities of High-
land, San Bernardino, 
Redlands, Loma Lin-
da, Grand Terrace and 
Colton within San Ber-
nardino County, all of 
which comprise a popu-
lation of around 443,000, 
draw their water. The 
above ground and un-
derground flow of water 
through the Bunker Hill 
Basin further impacts the 
Santa Ana River and the 
Rialto-Colton basin, im-
pacting another 300,000 
people or more.

The Bunker Hill 
Basin is primarily re-
charged from streams 
and runoff from the San 
Bernardino Mountains, 
including Strawberry 
Creek, which descends 
all the way from Straw-
berry Canyon near the 
5,000-foot elevation, 
wending to the area near 
Coldwater Canyon near 
the Arrowhead Springs 
Hotel; Coldwater Creek; 
East Twin Creek; water 
flow through Little Sand 
Canyon; City Creek; and 
the water flow through 
Borea Canyon. Some 
of these streams are in-
volved in the land ex-
change between the tribe 
and the U.S. Forest Ser-
vice.

Three water districts 
have full or partial juris-
diction over the Bunker 
Hill Basin, those being 
the East Valley Water 
District,  the San Ber-
nardino Valley Munici-
pal Water District and 
the San Bernardino Val-
ley Water Conservation 
District.

In addition, the San 
Bernardino Municipal 
Water Department sup-
plies water to San Ber-
nardino residents, the 
City of Redlands Mu-
nicipal Utilities Depart-
ment operates a water 
distribution system for 
Redlands residents, the 
City of Loma Linda has 
its own water produc-
tion division, the Riv-
erside Highland Water 
Company serves the City 
of Grand Terrace and 
Colton’s municipal util-
ity division supplies wa-
ter to Colton residents. 
All of those entities uti-
lize water from the Bun-
ker Hill Basin.

The San Bernardino 
Valley Water Conserva-
tion District was formed 

to monitor the Bunker 
Hill Basin.

A 2024 engineering 
report commissioned 
by the San Bernardino 
Valley Water Conserva-
tion District shows the 
Bunker Hill Basin is in 
a state of overdraft, with 
more water being taken 
out of the aquifer than 
what it is experiencing in 
water recharge on an an-
nual basis.

There has been lim-
ited publicity with re-
gard to House Resolu-
tion 3925 and Senate 
Bill 2796. While over 
the past several years as 
the land swap concept 
has taken shape few 
people took notice of it 
or its implication, in re-
cent weeks and months 
a growing number of 
San Bernardino Valley’s 
residents are waking up 
to the likelihood that the 
tribe will use whatever 
water rights it can claim 
in the foothills to make 
up for the discontinued 
flow of water through 
the pipeline descending 
from Strawberry Canyon 
once the legal proceed-
ings relating to the Cali-
fornia Water Resources 
Control Board’s cease-
and-desist order end and 
the board’s order along 
with that of the U.S. For-
est Service relating to the 
decommissioning of the 
tunnels and horizontal 
boreholes BlueTriton in-
herited from Nestlé goes 
into effect.

Ever larger numbers 
of San Bernardino Val-
ley residents have come 
to recognize that deliv-
ering to the San Manuel 
Band of Mission In-
dians ownership and 
control over the 1,475.9 
acres of federal land in 
the foothills above San 
Bernardino and High-
land would give the tribe 
choke point control of 
the region’s water supply. 
The land the Yuhaavia-
tam of San Manuel Na-
tion will acquire under 
the agreement lies at a 
crucial juncture above 
the San Bernardino and 
Highland city limits, 
from which it could di-
vert to its own use much 
of the inland region’s wa-
ter resources.

Though senators Pa-
dilla and Schiff, whose 
range of responsibility 
extends to coverage of 
all 163,695 square miles 

of California might, per-
haps, be excused for not 
recognizing the impact 
transferring ownership 
of the 1,475 acres at the 
very top of the Bunker 
Hill Basin will have on 
San Bernardino Valley’s 
residents, those locals 
who are animated about 
the issue are unwilling 
to be forgiving of Ober-
nolte, who is respon-
sible for a much smaller 
geographical area and 
should, in their view, be 
far more sensitive to the 
impacts of the legislation 
he is sponsoring which 
will directly impact his 
district and the one im-
mediately adjacent to it 
to the south.

In recent weeks, Ober-
nolte was provided with 
documentation showing 
that the tribe has already 
been illegally diverting 
water from the Bunker 
Hill Basin. He spurned 
efforts by the Sentinel to 
initiate a dialogue with 
regard to that documen-
tation.

In the 1960s, both the 
Del Rosa Mutual Water 
Company, which at that 
time provided water to 
customers in San Ber-
nardino and in High-
land, and the City of San 
Bernardino, which had 
a 13.48 percent interest 
in the Del Rosa Mutual 
Water Company, were 
parties in a lawsuit relat-
ing to water use in the 
underlying Bunker Hill 
Basin. In 1969, that law-
suit was resolved pursu-
ant to a judicial decision 
that permits local water 
purveyors to draft from 
the local aquifer in a 
manner that is deemed 
to be a responsible uti-
lization of the regional 
water source, subject to 
restrictions in the event 
the water table becomes 
overdrafted.

A condition of that 
settlement was the con-
firmation of a previously 
enforced requirement 
that all entities drawing 
water from the basin fill 
out, annually, California 
State Form 505 docu-
ments registering and re-
cording water level read-
ings. Based upon the data 
extrapolated from those 
documents, well own-
ers, water pumpers and 
water purveyors could be 
limited in the amount of 
water they were taking 

Tribe, Already Tapping Into Forest H2O In  
A Deal With BlueTriton, Will Get More By 
Trade For Foothill Land Above The Bun-
ker Hill Basin Recharge Point  from page 3 
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what seemed to be his 
effort to intimidate those 
making the requests and 
his specific mention of 
Jensen that alarmed Jen-
sen. In response, Jensen 
filed multiple complaints 
with the San Bernardino 
County District Attor-
ney’s office and some 
local police departments 
over what she said were 
“public threats during an 
official meeting.”

According to Jensen, 
McEachron and Dowdy-
Rodgers came close to or 
in fact crossed the legal 
line on September 8 by 
violating the Ralph M. 
Brown Act, California’s 
open public meeting law, 
with their attempts to 
dissuade the public from 
obtaining district docu-
ments and data.

“Each member of a 
legislative body who at-
tends a meeting of that 
legislative body where 
action is taken in viola-
tion of the Act, and where 
the member intends to 
deprive the public of in-
formation to which the 
member knows or has 
reason to know the pub-
lic is entitled under this 

chapter, is guilty of a 
misdemeanor,” accord-
ing to California Gov-
ernment Code § 54959.

The Brown Act spe-
cifically prohibits of-
ficials from addressing 
or retaliating against 
public commenters from 
the dais, a protection 
designed to encourage 
public participation in 
government meetings 
without fear of retalia-
tion.

Beyond the personal 
references to herself 
which could be con-
strued as threats, Jensen 
noted, McEachron also 
directed staff resources 
be used for retaliation 
with the direction to De 
Nava, she maintains. 
Dowdy-Rodgers, as 
board president, not only 
failed to intervene but 
intensified the directive, 
according to Jensen.

The complaint alleges 
and outlines several spe-
cific violations, one of 
which pertained to Gov-
ernment Code § 54954.2, 
prohibiting action or 
discussion of items not 
on the agenda, and an-
other, Government Code 

§ 54954.3(c), which pro-
tects the public’s right to 
criticize and prohibits 
retaliation from the dais.

According to Jensen, 
the board engaged in 
improper deliberation 
in that it took action on 
creating the Public Re-
cords Act cost tracker 
without proper notice or 
a vote. The Brown Act 
requires that action to be 
discussed or voted upon 
be specified as an action 
item in an agenda for the 
meeting posted at least 
72 hours in advance of 
the meeting unless the 
matter involved consti-
tutes an “emergency.”

Jensen in her com-
plaint also cited one 
of the county school 
board’s own rules, that 
being Board Policy 113, 
which requires “consen-
sus” before items can be 
placed on future agen-
das, as constituting a vi-
olation of the Brown Act 
in that it authorizes de-
liberation without public 
notice.

Jensen contended 
that on September 8, the 
board failed to follow 
Board Policy 113 to the 
letter in that it was not 
clear a consensus of the 
board members had been 
achieved when De Nava 
was given direction to 
provide the cost calcula-

tor. The board has, how-
ever, established a past 
practice pattern of estab-
lishing a loose consen-
sus and accepting sug-
gestions made by board 
members unless a clear 
majority of the board 
members express oppo-
sition to a suggestion.

Jensen stepped onto 
a controversial plane 
when she took issue 
with the county school 
board’s rule with re-
gard to members of the 
public addressing the 
board at its meetings 
identifying themselves, 
a requirement identical 
to or not much differ-
ent from those imposed 
by other local govern-
mental entities such as 
school districts, water 
districts, city councils 
and the San Bernardino 
County Board of Su-
pervisors. Board Policy 
114 – Addressing the 
Board states, “The per-
son wishing to address 
the county board shall, 
when recognized by the 
county board president, 
step up to the rostrum 
and announce his or her 
name.”

Jensen contends that 
“Requiring the name 
or identifying informa-
tion of speakers is pro-
hibited by the Brown 
Act.” While this may or 

may not be technically 
correct, there is a long-
running custom and tra-
dition in San Bernardino 
County and elsewhere in 
California, one broadly 
considered to be in the 
interest of the open ex-
change of ideas and in-
formation, not to men-
tion civil courtesy, that 
individuals identify 
themselves during such 
public discussions.

Jensen’s position is 
that after the threats from 
the dais by McEachron, 
many citizens may fear 
providing their names or 
even speaking out at the 
county board of educa-
tion meetings.

Jensen contends that 
directing staff to prepare 
ongoing reports specifi-
cally to “shame” and re-
taliate against citizens 
exercising their legal 
rights under the Public 
Records Act constitutes 
misuse of taxpayer re-
sources for political 
ends.

Jensen’s complaint 
references raised 
safety concerns over 
McEachron’s outburst 
and Dowdy-Rodgers 
support for him. She has 
requested that the dis-
trict attorney require law 
enforcement presence at 
future board meetings, 
including metal detec-

tors and bag checks. The 
complaint also requests 
that McEachron be re-
stricted to participating 
in meetings only via 
Zoom “to protect public 
safety and preserve the 
integrity of meetings.”

Jensen is seeking sev-
eral remedies from the 
district attorney’s office. 
She is requesting crimi-
nal investigation of both 
trustees for Brown Act 
violations and misuse of 
public authority, suspen-
sion of Board Policy 113 
as an ongoing Brown Act 
violation, cessation of all 
staff work on the Cali-
fornia Public Records 
Act cost-tracking effort 
and enhanced security 
measures at future board 
meetings. She is asking 
the district attorney’s 
office to assess criminal 
and civil penalties au-
thorized under the law 
for Brown Act violations 
to include criminal mis-
demeanor charges, in-
junctions and civil fines 
as deemed appropriate.

The San Bernardino 
County District Attor-
ney’s office has not yet 
responded to the com-
plaint.

In addition, Jensen 
wants the full board of 
education to formally 
censure of Board Presi-

meyer – each owned 
and operated his own 
ambulance company. 
Each had been granted 
access to the emergency 
dispatch center’s radio 
transmissions, and when 
a call for an ambulance 
went out, depending on 
where their vehicles hap-
pened to be at the time, 
they or the other drivers 
they employed would 
rush to the scene, trying 
to be the first to arrive 
and get the privilege of 
– and the money for – 
transporting the injured 
party to the hospital. 
Over the years, all four 
experienced hundreds 
of incidents where one 
would be traveling full 
tilt in one direction to get 
to an accident or medical 
emergency and would 
pass another going in the 
opposite direction to get 

to another person in need 
of medical assistance. In 
the late 1970s, the four 
got together, smoked a 
peace pipe, and resolved 
to stop their blind com-
petition and instead co-
ordinate their responses 
by apportioning the 
shared geography they 
were serving into op-
erating zones. The next 
step was to merge their 
separate companies into 
one – which was called 
Mercy Ambulance.

Fortified by the in-
creased profits that re-
sulted from their merg-
er, the four directors of 
Mercy Ambulance were 
able  to make political 
donations to members 
of the board of super-
visors, to the various 
city council members in 
the communities where 
Mercy was entrenched 
and to the county sher-
iff. Within  three years 
of its formation, Mercy 
Ambulance became a 
major political donor and 
player, rivaling develop-

ers and other holders of 
the county’s various ser-
vice franchises. Using 
that influence, it began 
to squeeze smaller am-
bulance companies out 
of the San Bernardino 
County picture entirely, 
buying them out, forc-
ing them into bank-
ruptcy  or driving them 
out of the area. With or 
without being granted 
exclusive operating ar-
eas, Mercy claimed a 
virtual monopoly in San 
Bernardino County, such 
that its only competitors 
were the ones willing to 
run just one or two am-
bulances in remote lo-
cations where it was not 
profitable for Mercy  to 
operate.

Mercy’s advantage 
and profitability had be-
come so overwhelming 
that it was able to create 
an air division, consist-
ing of helicopter ambu-
lances which could fly 
to remote areas of the 
desert and mountains to 
retrieve and transport 

the injured in a fraction 
of the time it would take 
to reach them by tradi-
tional ground-based am-
bulance. This put Mercy 
Ambulance on the cut-
ting edge of the ambu-
lance industry, which 
over the course of a 
decade-and-a-half made 
Russ, Aerts, Reed and 
Dickmeyer fabulously 
wealthy. By the late 
1990s, the four were in 
their late 50s and 60s and 
had grown weary of the 
bustle and intensity of 
providing a service with 
life-or-death implica-
tions 24 hours a day and 
365 days per year. They 
sold Mercy Air Ambu-
lance to a Japanese com-
pany and headed into a 
comfortable retirement.

That left a vacuum, 
which a few companies, 
including some start-ups  
and a few with existing 
operations just outside 
the county’s periphery, 
sought to fill. Gradu-
ally at first and then with 
greater ruthlessness as it 

succeeded, Greenwood 
Village, Colorado-based 
American Medical Re-
sponse, Inc. –  AMR – 
took over from Mercy 
as the county’s preemi-
nent emergency medical 
transport provider. The 
company took a leaf out 
of Mercy’s playbook and 
began making substan-
tial political contribu-
tions, primarily to in-
cumbent politicians, in 
an effort to ingratiate the 
company with the pow-
ers that be, in essence 
solidifying its hold on 
the exclusive operating 
zones that had by that 
point become an intrin-
sic part of the ambulance 
industry in California 
and in San Bernardino 
County. The smaller am-
bulance companies com-
peting for a piece of the 
San Bernardino County 
pie, like those that two 
and three decades previ-
ously had tried to stay in 
place while Mercy was 
taking over, could not 
afford to  buy such in-

fluence through political 
donations. Soon, those 
companies dried up and 
blew away, at least in 
San Bernardino County.

For two decades 
AMR was, within San 
Bernardino County, the 
primary corporate ben-
eficiary of the move to-
ward exclusive operating 
zones in San Bernardino 
County.  It is notewor-
thy, however, that the 
San Bernardino County 
supervisors  who gave 
AMR the inside track in 
San Bernardino County 
did not use their author-
ity as members of the 
ICEMA  board  to im-
pose AMR as the sole 
ambulance service pro-
vider in Inyo and Mono 
counties. 

Symons Ambulance 
was a primary provider 
of ambulance service 
in Inyo County from 
1989 until 2023,  when 
it thereafter withdrew 
from the area to cut its 
losses.  Since that time, 

Continued on Page 8 
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or they could be outright 
prohibited from drafting 
water from the Bunker 
Hill Basin altogether.

An exhaustive archi-
val examination com-
pleted in August deter-
mined that the Del Rosa 
Mutual Water Company 
made regular annual 
Form 505 filings from 
January 13, 1960 through 
March 19, 1986 in com-
pliance with the court 
settlement. From 1987 
onward to date, there is 
no documentation in the 
archives to show that 
either the company or 
its corporate successor 
made the required Form 
505 filings.

The San Manuel 
tribe’s efforts to obtain 
alternative water sources 
in preparation for further 

casino expansion as well 
as development of hous-
ing for its tribe mem-
bers included purchasing 
from the City of San Ber-
nardino in January 2019 
the city’s 13.48 percent 
interest in the Del Rosa 
Mutual Water Company.

Consequently, the San 
Manuel Band of Mis-
sion Indians increased 
its drafting of water at a 
lower elevation, at a level 
of 2,000-foot elevation 
and below, from East and 
West Twin Creeks, im-
pacting the water level 
in the Bunker Hill Basin. 
There is no record of the 
San Manuel Tribe hav-
ing filled out or filed the 
Form 505s relating to its 
water use in the San Ber-
nardino Mountain Foot-
hills.

The Sentinel made re-
peated efforts to engage 
Congressman Obernolte 
in a discussion with re-
gard to the tribe’s unwill-
ingness or demonstrated 
inability so far to make 
those Form 505 filings 
and whether the federal 

government should en-
ter into a deal giving the 
tribe title to the San Ber-
nardino Mountain Foot-
hill property that pre-
sumably will carry with 
it water rights within a 
crucial area of water re-
charge to the Bunker Hill 
Basin. The Sentinel, in 
particular, sought to ob-
tain Obernolte’s view as 
to whether the land swap 
should be delayed until 
it is ascertained whether 
the tribe, which is a sov-
ereign entity outside the 
strictures of California 
law, would be willing to 
abide by the same water 
use restrictions and reg-
ulations that other water 
users within the Bunker 
Hill Basin are bound by. 
Obernolte was unwill-
ing to engage in that dia-
logue.

The land currently 
owned by the tribe in 
the San Bernardino 
Mountains which is to 
be deeded to the Forest 
Service if the land swap 
goes through falls within 
Obernolte’s 23rd Con-

gressional District. Simi-
larly, the land in the foot-
hills that the tribe is to 
obtain in the trade falls 
within the 23rd Congres-
sional District. While the 
top end of the Bunker 
Hill Basin just along the 
San Bernardino Moun-
tain Foothills lies within 
Obernolte’s jurisdiction, 
roughly six-sevenths to 
seven-eighths of of the 
Bunker Hill Basin, that 
being the most densely 
populated area overlying 
the Bunker Hill Basin’s 
water table, is enclosed 
within Congressman 
Pete Aguilar’s 33rd Con-
gressional District. 
Obernolte was unwill-
ing to discuss whether 
the area to be potentially 
or actually most heavily 
negatively impacted as a 
consequence of the land 
swap being outside his 
congressional district re-
sulted in his disregard of 
those impacts. Nor was 
he willing to say wheth-
er he had discussed the 
advisability of having 
the Forest Service make 

the land trade with Con-
gressman Aguilar.

In a brief public state-
ment made regarding 
why he was sponsoring 
the legislation, Obernolte 
alluded to the matter of 
the land trade being “tied 
up in red tape,” which 
appeared to be a possible 
or actual reference to the 
State Water Resources 
Board’s and U.S. Forest 
Service’s actions impact-
ing the amount of water 
available to BlueTriton, 
which by extension im-
pacts the amount of wa-
ter available to the tribe. 
Efforts by the Sentinel to 
obtain clarification from 
Obernolte on what his 
precise meaning was did 
not succeed.

It appears that comply-
ing with the Forest Ser-
vice Land and Resource 
Management Plan, ripar-
ian and stream protec-
tion laws and policies, 
endangered species pro-
tection and water rights 
requirements could not 
have been accomplished 
using a normal land ex-

change processes, and it 
was therefore necessary 
to use House Resolution 
3925 and Senate Bill 
2796 to bypass those re-
strictions. Obernolte was 
unwilling to detail why 
he believes suspension of 
the normally applicable 
riparian, stream and en-
dangered species protec-
tions and maneuvering 
around traditional water 
rights requirements was 
justified in this case.

Obernolte turned 
down the Sentinel’s in-
vitation to weigh against 
one another the advanta-
geous and disadvanta-
geous aspects of the land 
swap.

Some San Bernardino 
Valley residents, includ-
ing those who might be 
deemed his political op-
ponents, suggested that 
Obernolte had sponsored 
the land trade as part of 
an untoward quid pro 
quo in which his reward 
is to come in the form 
of hefty monetary con-
tributions to his political 

and dutifully published 
defamatory stories – re-
porting so subjective 
that I’m doubting wheth-
er responsible editors 
ever intervened between 
writing and publication.

Because no respon-
sible adults seem to pop-
ulate local media any-
more, I dusted-off and 
donned my newspaper 
fedora and researched 
local and state public re-
cords involving Together 
For Redlands, its offi-
cers, and key supporters.

The revelations were 
stunning.

The Issues
In 2009, my last 

year as a reporter for 
the Press-Enterprise, 
I could walk into Red-
lands school board meet-
ings anytime and get a 
seat among dozens of 
empty chairs. Meetings 
were agitation-free and 
downright boring.

In 2020, COVID 
and masking policies 
prompted parents to start 
filling seats. After Olson 
and Wilson were elected 

in 2024, attendance ex-
ploded; immediately, 
people queued for hours 
in hopes of getting in-
side. Together turned 

queues into parties be-
fore and after meetings.

Attendance exploded 
as new policies emerged 
as lightning rods:

• Banning controver-
sial and special interest 
flags, such as pride and 
Black Lives Matter, to 
create politically neutral 

classrooms. The policy 
did allow for flags such 
as the American and 
California flags.

• Improving the pro-

cess with regard to how 
the public could review 
and object to controver-
sial books – in particular 
books so sexually ex-
plicit I am not going to 
name them.

• Preventing sexu-
ally explicit and vulgar 
reading materials from 
reaching students in 
classrooms, curriculum, 
and libraries.

Those three passed. 
Another electrifying is-
sue was stopping trans-
gender athletes from 
joining teams of the op-
posite sex, which was 
passed as a resolution.

More than any other 
objectionable book, the 
adult novel, “The Push” 
caught the ire of Olson 
and Wilson as well as 
their supporters. Several 
graphic passages depict 
rape and incest as well 
as oral and vaginal sex 
with children. In one 
scene, the book explic-
itly details how a father 
rapes his infant daughter 
while his wife sleeps in 
the same bed.

That book is available 
to middle-aged teens in 
the libraries of Orange-
wood and Citrus Valley 
high schools.

Full disclosure: I am 
an active supporter of 

Some leading mem-
bers of the progressive 
contingent within the 
Redlands community, a 
number of whom have 
been characterized by 
Candy Olson’s and Jean-
nette Wilson’s support-
ers as vicious, vile and 
vulgar in propounding 
their beliefs and being 
as or even more dog-
matic and rigid in their 
collective mindset than 
the conservatives they 
detest, insist they are 
engaged in an advocacy 
that is enlightened, hu-
mane and kind-spirited. 
While tacitly acknowl-
edging that their pas-
sion has sometimes been 
articulated profanely, 
they insist that theirs is a 
position of rectitude and 
compassion.

“Please be clear, while 
we may criticize elected 
officials for their actions 
and the policies they 
promote, accusing us of 
intimidation or threat-
ening behavior is inac-
curate and possibly li-

belous,” the progressive 
values group Together 
For Redlands stated in 
a communication with 
the Sentinel this week. 
“We never target friends, 
families, or associates of 
elected officials. Nor do 
we engage in intimida-
tion of anyone. We publi-
cize and criticize actions 
and policies we disagree 
with in an attempt to 
keep the public informed 
and engaged.”

Conservative forces 
in Redlands assert that 
Together for Redlands 
and other liberals in the 
community were not 
able to prevent a tradi-
tional values coalition 
from taking control of 
the school board as a 
result of the 2024 elec-
tion. The reality is, the 
traditionalists maintain, 
that those promoting 
transgenderism among 
students, those calling 
for the presence of gay 
pride flags on campus 
and in classrooms, those 
in favor of indoctrinat-

ing students with liberal 
political ideas, expos-
ing students to radical 
ideologies and sexually 
explicit reading material 
and texts are a minor-
ity and a small minor-
ity at that, despite being 
so vocal. Outnumbered 
and beaten at the ballot 
box, the progressives, 
according to the com-
munity’s conservatives, 
have turned to bullying 
and intimidation to get 
their way.

That is not the case, 
the progressives counter.

“Characterizing our 
tactics as bullying with-
out the political muscle 
to accomplish is wholly 
inaccurate,” Together 
For Redlands in a group 
communique told the 
Sentinel. “In fact, Cali-
fornia law is on our side 
as demonstrated by both 
the Chino and Temecu-
la [school district] flag 
bans being overturned 
based on California Pub-
lic Employment Rela-
tions Board litigation. 

In addition, California 
law prohibits book bans 
targeting marginalized 
communities which is 
documented as the intent 
of the Redlands book re-
view policy.”

As the district has en-
acted policy after policy 
that has not been to the 
liking of Redlands’ pro-
gressive contingent over 
the ten months since 
Olson and Wilson were 
sworn into positions on 
the school board fol-
lowing their November 
2024 election victories, 
members of the city’s 
conservative set have 
openly remarked at how 
politically tone deaf the 
Redlands liberals are. 
Instead of courting Mi-
chelle Rendler, the swing 
vote on the school board, 
the traditionalists point 
out, the progressives 
have offended and insult-
ed her with their pointed 
verbal abuse, personal 
attacks, profanity and 
departures from deco-

Protests Grew 
More And More 
Cacophonous As 
The Conservative 
School Board Suc-
cessfully Pursued 
Its Agenda  from 
page 3

Indications Are 
Obernolte Did 
Not Actually Au-
thor HR 3925, But 
Agreed Neverthe-
less To Introduce It   
from page 5 

Fighting For What Is Just & Good Necessitates Demonizing Olson
    Wilson & Rendler, Redlands Progressive Leadership Asserts  

Continued on Page 13
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Ambulance Company 
With A Two Decade-
Plus Monopoly On 
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planted By A Consor-
tium Of The County’s 
Fire Departments  
from page 6
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the fire departments and 
the hospital districts   of 
the county’s various 
communities have pro-
vided ambulance ser-
vice in Inyo County. The 
main ambulance service 
provider in Mono Coun-
ty is the county’s own 
Mono County EMS, a 
government-operated 
service that provides 
both pre-hospital care 
and inter-facility ambu-
lance transport.

Some critics have long 
disputed that the exclu-
sive operating zones are 
necessary, asserting that 
the zone system is rather 
a ploy by which county 
politicians have further 
inculcated a pay-to-play 
ethos into the county’s 
governmental function, 
with the exclusive op-
erating permits being 
granted to the companies  
that are most generous 
in handing out political 
donations to incumbent 
politicians. Among those 
critics of exclusive op-
erating zones are some 
who maintain the mo-
nopolistic system has 
long endangered pub-
lic safety. One of those 
was San Bernardino 
County’s firefighters’ 
union, known as Local 
935, which in 2014 sug-
gested the exclusive op-
erating approach has on 
occasion created critical 
shortages in the High 
Desert’s ambulance 
transport system.

For years, the county’s 
decision-makers ignored 
the firefighters’ warn-
ings,  allowing the AMR 
contract  to be “rolled 
over” in what the county 
referred to as “a grandfa-
thered process.” In late 
2022, however, county 
officials began to  con-
sider what action  might 
be taken with regard to 
the expiration or contin-
uation of the AMR con-
tract. On December 20, 
2022, the county  issued 
a request for proposals 
– a solicitation of bids – 
inviting prospective pro-
viders to provide ground 
ambulance service in 11 
of the county’s 26 exclu-

sive operating areas.
The only two enti-

ties responding  to the 
request were AMR 
and Consolidated Fire 
Agencies. Known by 
its acronym CONFIRE, 
Consolidated Fire Agen-
cies is a joint powers 
authority that provides 
communications, dis-
patch, computer infor-
mation systems support 
and geographic location 
information to its nine 
founding member agen-
cies – the Apple Valley 
Fire Protection District, 
Chino Valley Indepen-
dent Fire District, the 
Colton Fire Department, 
the Loma Linda Fire De-
partment, the Rancho 
Cucamonga Fire Depart-
ment, the Redlands Fire 
Department, the Rialto 
Fire Department, the 
San Bernardino County 
Fire District and the Vic-
torville Fire Department 
– and four later-joining 
contract agencies – the 
Big Bear Fire Depart-
ment, the Montclair Fire 
Department, the Run-
ning Springs Fire Dis-
trict and the San Manuel 
Fire Department.

In its response to the 
request for proposals, 
AMR stated it could 
commit 12,889 weekly 
unit hours to respond to 
calls and that it had 111 
ambulances stationed 
throughout the service 
area available during 
times of  peak system 
demand,  with 39 addi-
tional  ambulances avail-
able to meet surges. It 
emphasized that it was 
the current provider of 
the services with vehicle 
infrastructure in place 
and that it employed 10 
managers and 18 field 
supervisors and a medi-
cal director familiar with 
the needs of the service 
area. The company of-
fered rates of $3,958 for 
both basic life support 
and advanced life sup-
port, $2,834 to carry out 
an interfacility trans-
port, and $4,392 for criti-
cal care transport.

In its  proposal, CON-
FIRE said it would sub-
contract with Priority 
Ambulance, which also 
serves Maricopa County 
in Arizona and  could 
devote 10,371 weekly 
unit hours to respond to 
calls, that it would have 
93 ambulances available 
at peak demand, with 
45 additional ambu-

lances available to meet 
surges throughout the 
service area, and that it  
would establish ambu-
lance staging locations, 
put on-board person-
nel in place and acquire 
vehicles upon receiving 
the contract. It offered 
an assurance that it  had 
sufficient leadership and 
management personnel 
to meet the demands of 
providing the service, 
including nine manag-
ers and 18 operations 
supervisors, as well as a 
medical director, noting 
it currently  controlled 
the regional emergency 
services communica-
tion system. Its proposed 
rates for its advance life 
support service were 
$3,547 for non-emer-
gency and interfacility 
transfer, $4,053 for emer-
gency transport, $2,533 
for non-emergency ba-
sic life transport,  $3,167 
for emergency basic life 
transport and  $5,067 for 
critical care transport.

To determine which 
company would be 
awarded the contract,  
the county  convened 
an “independent review 
panel” made up of four 
evaluators who individu-
ally scored each pro-
posal on 14 key areas: 
system requirements, 
response time standards, 
clinical performance, 
deployment plans, ve-
hicles, medical supplies 
and equipment, person-
nel, hospital and com-
munity requirements, 
disaster preparedness/re-
sponse, quality manage-
ment, electronic patient 
care reports, centralized 
emergency medical dis-
patching, financial and 
administrative require-
ments qualifications, and 
future system enhance-
ments.  The panel gave 
the AMR proposal a to-
tal cumulative score of 
1,519 points (out of 1,720 
points maximum) and 
the CONFIRE proposal 
a total cumulative score 
of 1,515.

 Given what  they 
characterized as the 
negligible difference be-
tween the two scores, 
county officials  invited 
both AMR and CON-
FIRE  to enter into con-
tract negotiations with 
the county,  indicating 
that  final contract ap-
proval rested with the 
board of supervisors.

At the conclusion of 

those negotiations in 
late October of 2023, 
the board of supervisors  
decided to offer CON-
FIRE the contract to 
provide ambulance ser-
vice for San Bernardino 
County from October 
2024 through September 
2029. AMR was granted 
a six-month extension of 
its then-current contract 
to give CONFIRE time 
to prepare to assume its 
new responsibility in 
San Bernardino County, 
but nevertheless lost its 
bid for the new contract, 
despite having submitted 
a proposal that received 
a marginally superior 
score from the county’s 
evaluators.

AMR lodged a pro-
test, alleging the county 
had failed to follow the 
selection procedures,  
had not adhered to re-
quirements specified in 
the request for proposal, 
had awarded the contract 
to the entity that had lost 
in the competition, and  
had otherwise violated 
state and/or federal law. 
The county’s purchasing 
agent, Ariel Gill, after 
reviewing and consider-
ing the protest, notified 
AMR of its decision to 

deny it.
At its December 5, 

2023  meeting, the board 
of supervisors unani-
mously passed a motion  
to deny AMR’s appeal 
and to schedule a vote on 
whether to award the con-
tract to CONFIRE and 
its private subcontrac-
tor, Priority Ambulance. 
Present at the meeting 
were an AMR  spokes-
man who did not iden-
tify himself and Mike 
Rice, the company’s vice 
president of operations, 
who made no comments. 
The unidentified spokes-
man said AMR offered 
“stability, performance 
and clinical excellence. 
AMR is in the best posi-
tion to take this into the 
future. We’re fully inte-
grated with the fire de-
partments, public health, 
behavioral health, the 
communities we serve.” 
He emphasized that 
AMR had a “depth of 
resources, history of per-
formance, experience 
and expertise, disaster 
response capability and 
represents a lower risk of 
liability to the cities and 
county than having pub-
lic agencies  provide am-
bulance service.” He said 

that AMR  “meets or ex-
ceeds all response time 
standards” and featured 
as part of its vehicle fleet 
“all-wheel-drive units in 
key areas that need that 
… and a disaster com-
mand vehicle.” He said 
the company had heli-
copter ambulances and 
was “financially strong,” 
with an “established sus-
tainable model.”

CONFIRE was repre-
sented at the meeting by 
Rancho Cucamonga City 
Councilwoman Lynn 
Kennedy, the chair-
woman of the CON-
FIRE Board of Direc-
tors, as well as Rancho 
Cucamonga Fire Chief 
Mike McCliman and 
CONFIRE Chief Nathan 
Cook. Lynne Kennedy 
said what CONFIRE of-
fered was something that 
“will result in increased 
resources, decreased 
response times and a 
delivery model that in-
cludes private/public 
partnership, a private 
partnership with Prior-
ity Ambulance that has 
the capacity to serve our 
county and the public 
partnership that crosses 
the continuum of care, 

Soup on the rocks.
Campbell’s Beef Broth right out of the can and onto ice. Take it

 straight  or add a dash of Worcestershire or lemon peel for a kicky 
switch. Great way to cool off on a hot day. It’s perfect for dieters, too.

Only 16 calories in a 5-ounce serving. Don’t even wait for
a real hot day; start pouring now. Cheers!

                                                                   

                                                            M’m! M’m! Good!



Public Notices Public Notices Public Notices Public Notices Public Notices Public Notices Public Notices
FBN20250008588
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

MAKEUP & HAIRSTYLE BY 
NC  1101 S. MILLIKEN AVE. STE. 
E  ONTARIO, CA 91761: ANA G. 
NAVARRO CERROS [and] RAUL 
E NAVARRO AMAYA 

Business Mailing Address:  
6865 SHELTON CT.  RANCHO 
CUCAMONGA, CA 91701  

The business is conducted by: 
A MARRIED COUPLE

The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
above on: May 20, 2025

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/    ANA G. NAVARRO CER-
ROS

Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
09/11/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy A5235

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on September 
19, & 26 and October 3 & 10, 2025.

FBN20250008195
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

BLEEPS EVENTS 10166 
TAMARISK AVE HESPERIA, CA 
92345: ANTONIO GARCIA SR.  

Business Mailing Address:   
10166 TAMARISK AVE HESPE-
RIA, CA 92345

The business is conducted by: 
AN INDIVIDUAL 

The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
above on: August 28, 2025

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/   ANTONIO M GARCIA 
SR., Owner

Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
09/02/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy J4646

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on September 
19, & 26 and October 3 & 10, 2025.

FBN20250007128
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

MY THREE LITTLE STARS 
CHILDCARE [and] MY 3 LITTLE 
STARS CHILD CARE 150 GLEN-
WOOD STREET  COLTON, CA 
92324: ELVIA CARDIEL  [and] 
FRANCISCO  E DIAZ

Business Mailing Address:    
150 GLENWOOD STREET  
COLTON, CA 92324

The business is conducted by: 
A MARRIED COUPLE 

The registrant commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed above on: July 15, 2025

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 

of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/   ELVIA CARDIEL, Owner
Statement filed with the Coun-

ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
07/28/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy J7527

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Ber-
nardino County Sentinel on August 
8, 15, 22 & 29, 2025. Corrected on 
September 19 & 26 and October 3 
& 9.

FBN20250007374  
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

  UPLAND CHIROPRAC-
TIC CLINIC 377 N 2nd  AVE. UP-
LAND, CA 91786:  ARNALDO 
ALEMAN CHIROPRACTIC, 
INC  3777 N 2nd AVE. UPLAND, 
CA 91786   

Business Mailing Address:      
377 N 2nd AVE. UPLAND, CA 
91786

The business is conducted 
by: A CORPORATION registered 
with the State of California.

The registrant commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed above on: April 1, 1990

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/  ARNALDO ALEMAN, 
President    

Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
08/05/2025 

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy K1587 

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on July 18 & 25 
and August 1 & 8, 2025. Corrected 
on September 19 & 26 and October 
3 & 10.

FBN20250006413  
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

ARNALDO ALEMAN CHI-
ROPRACTIC, INC  [and]  UP-
LAND CHIROPRACTIC CLINIC 
377 N 2nd AVE. UPLAND, CA 
91786:  ARNALDO ALEMAN 
CHIROPRACTIC, INC  3777 N 2nd 
AVE. UPLAND, CA 91786   

Business Mailing Address:      
377 N 2nd AVE. UPLAND, CA 
91786

The business is conducted 
by: A CORPORATION registered 
with the State of California.

The registrant commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed above on: April 1, 1990

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/  ARNALDO ALEMAN, 
President    

Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
07/10/2025 

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy K5932 

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 

the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on July 18 & 25 
and August 1 & 8, 2025. Corrected 
on August 15, 22 29 and September 
5, 2025.  Corrected on September 
19 & 26 and October 3 & 10.

FBN20250007340
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

LAKE SIDE CAFE LLC 
32300 SAN TIMOTEO CANYON 
ROAD  REDLANDS, CA 92373:  
LAKE SIDE CAFE LLC 32300 
SAN TIMOTEO CANYON ROAD  
REDLANDS, CA 92373

Business Mailing Address:   
14711 MANZANITA PARK RD, 
SPACE 54    BEAUMONT, CA  
92223

The business is conducted by: 
A LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY registered with the State of 
California. 

The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names list-
ed above on: August 4, 2025

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/   MARC WILLIS, CEO
Statement filed with the Coun-

ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
08/04/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy K1587

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on August 15, 
22, 29 and September 5, 2025. Cor-
rected on September 19 & 26 and 
October 3 & 10.

FBN20250008305
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

MANE CUSTOM BASS  7140 
SANTA BARBARA CT  FON-
TANA, CA  92336: MANE EN-
TERPRISE LLC    7140 SANTA 
BARBARA CT  FONTANA, CA  
92336

Business Mailing Address:    
7140 SANTA BARBARA CT  
FONTANA, CA  92336

The business is conducted by: 
A LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY registered with the State of 
California. 

The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
above on: July 16, 2025

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/    KENNETH D JAMES. 
President 

Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
09/04/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy A5235

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on September 
19 & 26 and October 3 & 10, 2025.

NOTICE OF PETI-
TION TO ADMINISTER 
ESTATE OF:  MICHAEL 
RAY TAYLOR, SR. 
CASE NO. PROVV2500316

To all heirs, beneficiaries, 
creditors, contingent credi-
tors, and persons who may 
otherwise be interested in the 
will or estate, or both of  MI-
CHAEL RAY TAYLOR, 
SR.: a petition for probate 
has been filed by  BRENDA 
CHATMAN  in the Superior 
Court of California, County 
of SAN BERNARDINO. 
THE PETITION for Pro-
bate requests that   BRENDA 
CHATMAN  be appointed as 
personal representative to ad-
minister the estate of the de-
cedent.

THE PETITION requests 
the decedent’s will and codi-
cils, if any, be admitted to pro-
bate. The will and any codicils 
are available for examination 
in the file kept by the court.

THE PETITION requests 
authority to administer the 
estate under the Independent 
Administration of Estates Act. 
(This authority will allow the 
personal representative to take 
many actions without obtain-
ing court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required 
to give notice to interested per-
sons unless they have waived 
notice or consented to the pro-
posed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority 
will be granted unless an in-
terested person files an objec-
tion to the petition and shows 
good cause why the court 
should not grant the authority. 
A hearing on the peti-
tion will be held October 
21, 2025 at 9:00 a.m. at: 
San Bernardino County Supe-
rior Court – Victorville District 
14455 Civic Drive 
Victorville, CA 92392 
Branch Name: Probate Division 
Department: V-12 
IF YOU OBJECT to the 
granting of the petition, you 
should appear at the hearing 
and state your objections or 
file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in 
person or by your attorney. 
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR 
or a contingent creditor of 
the decedent, you must file 
your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal 
representative appointed by 
the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from 
the date of first issuance of 
letters to a general personal 
representative, as defined in 
section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days 
from the date of mailing or 
personal de-livery to you of a 
notice under Section 9052 of 
the California Probate Code. 
Other California statutes 
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credi-
tor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledge-
able in California law. 
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a 
person interested in the estate, 
you may file with the court 
a Request for Special Notice 
(form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of 
estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Pro-
bate Code section 1250. A Re-
quest for Special Notice form is 
available from the court clerk. 
Brenda Chatman 
14680 Luna Road 
Victorville, CA 93392 
(909) 753-8010 
Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on  Sep-
tember 26 and October 3 & 10, 
2025.

NOTICE OF PETI-
TION TO ADMINISTER 
ESTATE OF: CRAIG 
MARTIN KOCESKI

CASE NO. 
P R O V V 2 5 0 0 3 3 5 
To all heirs, beneficiaries, 
creditors, contingent credi-

tors, and persons who may 
otherwise be interested in 
the will or estate, or both of 
CRAIG MARTIN KOCESKI: 
a petition for probate has been 
filed by DANIEL CRAIG 
KOCESKI in the Superior 
Court of California, County 
of SAN BERNARDINO. 
THE PETITION for Probate 
requests that DANIEL CRAIG 
KOCESKI be appointed as 
personal representative to ad-
minister the estate of the de-
cedent.

THE PETITION requests 
authority to administer the 
estate under the Independent 
Administration of Estates Act. 
(This authority will allow the 
personal representative to take 
many actions without obtain-
ing court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required 
to give notice to interested per-
sons unless they have waived 
notice or consented to the pro-
posed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority 
will be granted unless an in-
terested person files an objec-
tion to the petition and shows 
good cause why the court 
should not grant the authority. 
A hearing on the peti-
tion will be held Novem-
ber 4, 2025 at 9:00 a.m. at: 
San Bernardino County Supe-
rior Court – Victorville District 
14455 Civic Drive 
Victorville, CA 92392 
Branch Name: Probate Division 
Department: V-12 
IF YOU OBJECT to the 
granting of the petition, you 
should appear at the hearing 
and state your objections or 
file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in 
person or by your attorney. 
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR 
or a contingent creditor of 
the decedent, you must file 
your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal 
representative appointed by 
the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from 
the date of first issuance of 
letters to a general personal 
representative, as defined in 
section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days 
from the date of mailing or 
personal de-livery to you of a 
notice under Section 9052 of 
the California Probate Code. 
Other California statutes 
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credi-
tor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledge-
able in California law. 
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a 
person interested in the estate, 
you may file with the court 
a Request for Special Notice 
(form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of 
estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Pro-
bate Code section 1250. A Re-
quest for Special Notice form is 
available from the court clerk. 
Attorney for Dan-
iel Craig Koceski: 
Mathew Alden (Califor-
nia Bar Number 288429) 
255 North D Street Suite 200 
San Bernardino, CA 92401 
(909) 414-0797 
m r a l d e n 1 2 3 @ g m a i l . c o m 
Published in the San Ber-
nardino County Sentinel on 
September 26 and October 3 & 
10, 2025. 

ORDER TO SHOW 
CAUSE FOR CHANGE 
OF NAME CASE

NUMBER CIV SB 
2526928

TO ALL INTEREST-
ED PERSONS: Petitioner 
PEDRO ALEJANDRO 
VAZQUEZ  filed with this 
court for a decree changing 
names as follows:

 PEDRO ALEJANDRO 
VAZQUEZ     to    ALEX 
VAZQUEZ

THE COURT ORDERS 

that all persons interested in 
this matter appear before this 
court at the hearing indicated 
below to show cause, if any, 
why the petition for change of 
name should not be granted. 
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described above 
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter is 
scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written 
objection is timely filed, the 
court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

Notice of Hearing:
Date: November 26, 2025, 

Time: 09: AM, Department: 
S 24

The address of the court is 
Superior Court of California, 
County of San Bernardino, 
San Bernardino District-Civil 
Division, 247 West Third 
Street, San Bernardino, CA 
92415

IT IS FURTHER OR-
DERED that a copy of this 
order be published in the  San 
Bernardino County Sentinel, 
once a week for four succes-
sive weeks prior to the date set 
for hearing of the petition.

Dated: 09/23/2025
Judge of the Superior 

Court: Gilbert G. Ochoa
Shuai Zhou, Deputy Clerk 

of the Court
Published in the San Ber-

nardino County Sentinel on 
September 26 and October 3, 
10 & 17, 2025.

FBN20250008447
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

PARKER HOUSE FURNI-
TURE 

[and] PARKER LIVING FUR-
NITURE

[and] PARKER HOUSE IN-
TERNATIONAL

[and] INVISIMAT
 5200 E. AIRPORT DR. 

SUITE B  ONTARIO, CA 91761: 
PARKER HOUSE MANUFAC-
TURING COMPANY INC   5200 
E. AIRPORT DR. SUITE B  ON-
TARIO, CA 91761

Business Mailing Address:    
5200 E. AIRPORT DR. SUITE B  
ONTARIO, CA 91761

The business is conducted by: 
A CORPORATION registered with 
the State of California under the 
number 1574609

The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
above on: May 01, 1991

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/   CHRISTOPHER LUPO, 
President & CEO

Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
09/09/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy A5235

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on September 
26 and October 3, 10 & 17, 2025.

FBN20250008106
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

DAD’S GARAGE AUTO 
SHOP  1687  W ARROW RTE 
UNIT A  UPLAND, CA 91786:  
CORDOVA’S AUTO SOLUTION, 
INC  1072  W 9TH ST. UPLAND, 
CA 91786 

   Business Mailing Address:    
6909 STONECROP LANE  FON-
TANA, CA 92336  

The business is conducted 
by: A CORPORATION registered 
with the State of California

The registrant commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed above on: N/A

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/   GUSTAVO CORDOVA. 
President

Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
08/26/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy A5235

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on August 29 
and September 5, 12 & 19, 2025. 
Corrected on September 26 and 
October 3, 10 & 17, 2025.

FBN20250008015
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

THE GOD’S WAY MOVE-
MENT   9431 HAVEN AVE SUITE 
100  RANCHO CUCAMONGA, 
CA 91730:  COURSE AND 
COACHING LLC  9431 HAVEN 
AVE  100  RANCHO CUCAMON-
GA, CA 91730 

   Business Mailing Address:    
9431 HAVEN AVE SUITE 100  
RANCHO CUCAMONGA, CA 
91730

The business is conducted by: 
A LIMITED LIABILITY COM-
PANY registered with the State of 
California

The registrant commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed above on: N/A

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/   DENNIS M WEST, CEO
Statement filed with the Coun-

ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
08/22/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy J9965

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on August 29 
and September 5, 12 & 19, 2025. 
Corrected on September 26 and 
October 3, 10 and 17, 2025.

NOTICE OF PETI-
TION TO ADMIN-
ISTER ESTATE OF: 
JEFFREY OVADIA 
CASE NO. PROVV2500345
To all heirs, beneficiaries, 
creditors, contingent credi-
tors, and persons who may 
otherwise be interested in the 
will or estate, or both of JEF-
FREY OVADIA: a petition for 
probate has been filed by JA-
SON OVADIA in the Superior 
Court of California, County 
of SAN BERNARDINO. 
THE PETITION for Probate 
requests that JASON OVA-
DIA be appointed as personal 
representative to administer 
the estate of the decedent. 
THE PETITION requests 
authority to administer the 
estate under the Independent 
Administration of Estates Act. 
(This authority will allow the 
personal representative to take 
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many actions without obtain-
ing court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required 
to give notice to interested per-
sons unless they have waived 
notice or consented to the pro-
posed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority 
will be granted unless an in-
terested person files an objec-
tion to the petition and shows 
good cause why the court 
should not grant the authority. 
A hearing on the peti-
tion will be held Novem-
ber 6, 2025 at 9:00 a.m. at: 
San Bernardino County Supe-
rior Court – Victorville District 
14455 Civic Drive 
Victorville, CA 92392 
Branch Name: Probate Division 
Department: V-12 
IF YOU OBJECT to the 
granting of the petition, you 
should appear at the hearing 
and state your objections or 
file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in 
person or by your attorney. 
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR 
or a contingent creditor of 
the decedent, you must file 
your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal 
representative appointed by 
the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from 
the date of first issuance of 
letters to a general personal 
representative, as defined in 
section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days 
from the date of mailing or 
personal de-livery to you of a 
notice under Section 9052 of 
the California Probate Code. 
Other California statutes 
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credi-
tor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledge-
able in California law. 
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a 
person interested in the estate, 
you may file with the court 
a Request for Special Notice 
(form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of 
estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Pro-
bate Code section 1250. A Re-
quest for Special Notice form is 
available from the court clerk. 
Attorney for Jason Ovadia: 
Mathew Alden (Califor-
nia Bar Number 288429) 
255 North D Street Suite 200 
San Bernardino, CA 92401 
(909) 414-0797 
m r a l d e n 1 2 3 @ g m a i l . c o m 
Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on October 
3, 10 & 17, 2025. 

NOTICE OF PETI-
TION TO ADMINISTER 
ESTATE OF: JESUS MU-
NOZ

CASE NO. PRO-
VA2500758

To all heirs, beneficiaries, 
creditors, contingent creditors, 
and persons who may other-
wise be interested in the will 
or estate, or both of JESUS 
MUNOZ:

A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by MA 
REFUGIO MUNOZ in the 
Superior Court of California, 
County of SAN BERNARDI-
NO.

THE PETITION FOR 
PROBATE requests that MA 
REFUGIO MUNOZ be ap-
pointed as personal represen-
tatives to administer the estate 
of the decedent.

THE PETITION requests 
authority to administer the 
estate under the Independent 
Administration of Estates Act. 
(This authority will allow the 
personal representative to take 
many actions without obtain-
ing court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required 
to give notice to interested per-
sons unless they have waived 
notice or consented to the pro-
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posed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority 
will be granted unless an inter-
ested person files an objection 
to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.

A hearing on the petition 
will be held in Dept. F-1 at 9:00 
a.m. on November 13, 2025

San Bernardino County 
Superior Court Fontana Dis-
trict

Department F1 – Fontana
17780 Arrow Boulevard
Fontana, CA 92335
IF YOU OBJECT to the 

granting of the petition, you 
should appear at the hearing 
and state your objections or 
file written objections with the 
court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.

IF YOU ARE A CREDI-
TOR or a contingent creditor 
of the decedent, you must file 
your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal 
representative appointed by 
the court within the later of ei-
ther (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters 
to a general personal represen-
tative, as defined in section 
58(b) of the California Probate 
Code, or (2) 60 days from the 
date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under 
Section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code.

Other California statutes 
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a creditor. 
You may want to consult with 
an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.

YOU MAY EXAMINE 
the file kept by the court. If 
you are a person interested in 
the estate, you may file with 
the court a Request for Spe-
cial Notice (form DE-154) of 
the filing of an inventory and 
appraisal of estate assets or of 
any petition or account as pro-
vided in Probate Code section 
1250. A Request for Special 
Notice form is available from 
the court clerk.

Attorney for Ma Refugio 
Munoz:

ANTONIETTE JAU-
REGUI (SBN 192624)

1894 COMMERCENTER 
WEST, SUITE 108

SAN BERNARDINO, CA 
92408

Telephone No: (909) 890-
2350

Fax No: (909) 890-0106
ajprobatelaw@gmail.com
Published in the San Ber-

nardino County Sentinel on 
October 3, 10 & 17, 2025.

NOTICE OF PETI-
TION TO ADMINISTER 
ESTATE OF:

MANUEL RAMIREZ 
LUNA, JR

CASE NO. PROVA 
2500739

To all heirs, beneficiaries, 
creditors, contingent creditors, 
and persons who may other-
wise be interested in the will 
or estate, or both of MANUEL 
RAMIREZ LUNA, JR:

A PETITION FOR PRO-
BATE has been filed by RICH-
ARD EDWARD LUNA, SR 
in the Superior Court of Cali-
fornia, County of SAN BER-
NARDINO.

THE PETITION FOR 
PROBATE requests that 
RICHARD EDWARD LUNA, 
SR be appointed as personal 
representative to administer 
the estate of the decedent.

THE PETITION requests 
that the decedent’s will and 
codicils, if any, be admitted 
to probate. The will and any 
codicils are available for ex-
amination in the file kept by 
the court.

THE PETITION requests 
full authority to administer the 
estate under the Independent 
Administration of Estates Act. 
(This authority will allow the 
personal representative to take 
many actions without obtain-
ing court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 

actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required 
to give notice to interested per-
sons unless they have waived 
notice or consented to the pro-
posed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority 
will be granted unless an inter-
ested person files an objection 
to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.

A hearing on the petition 
will be held OCTOBER 30, 
2025 at 9:00 a.m. at

San Bernardino County 
Superior Court Fontana Dis-
trict

Department F1 – Fontana
17780 Arrow Boulevard
Fontana, CA 92335
Filed: SEPTEMBER 17, 

2025
MADISON YOUNG, 

Deputy Court Clerk.
IF YOU OBJECT to the 

granting of the petition, you 
should appear at the hearing 
and state your objections or 
file written objections with the 
court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.

IF YOU ARE A CREDI-
TOR or a contingent creditor 
of the decedent, you must file 
your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal 
representative appointed by 
the court within the later of ei-
ther (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters 
to a general personal represen-
tative, as defined in section 
58(b) of the California Probate 
Code, or (2) 60 days from the 
date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under 
Section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code.

Other California statutes 
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a creditor. 
You may want to consult with 
an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.

YOU MAY EXAMINE 
the file kept by the court. If 
you are a person interested in 
the estate, you may file with 
the court a Request for Spe-
cial Notice (form DE-154) of 
the filing of an inventory and 
appraisal of estate assets or of 
any petition or account as pro-
vided in Probate Code section 
1250. A Request for Special 
Notice form is available from 
the court clerk.

Attorney for Richard Ed-
ward Luna, Sr:

Jennifer M. Daniel
220 Nordina St.
Redlands, CA 92373
Telephone No: (909) 792-

9244 Fax No: (909) 235-4733
Email address: team@

lawofficeofjenniferdaniel.com
Published in the San Ber-

nardino County Sentinel on 
October 3, 10 & 17, 2025, 2024.

SUMMONS – (CITA-
CION JUDICIAL)

CASE NUMBER 
(NUMERO DEL CASO) 
CIVSB2515377

NOTICE TO:
EZ CABINETRY 

LLC., a California Limited 
Liability Company; WEI 
SHI, an individual and 
DOES 1-20, inclusive

(AVISO DEMANDA-
DO):

YOU ARE BEING 
SUED BY PLAINTIFF:

(LO ESTA DEMAN-
DANDO EL DEMAN-
DANTE):

LBA RV-COMPANY 
I, LP, a Delaware limited 
partnership

NOTICE! You have been 
sued. The court may decide 
against you without your be-
ing heard unless you respond 
within 30 days. Read the infor-
mation below.

You have 30 CALENDAR 
DAYS after this summons is 
served on you to file a written 
response at this court and have 
a copy served on the plaintiff. 
A letter or phone call will not 

protect you. Your written re-
sponse must be in proper legal 
form if you want the court to 
hear your case. There may be 
a court form that you can use 
for your response. You can find 
these court forms and more 
information at the California 
Courts Online Self-Help Cen-
ter (www.courtinfo.ca.gov/
selfhelp), your county law li-
brary, or the courthouse near-
est you. If you cannot pay the 
filing fee, ask the court clerk 
for a fee waiver form. If you do 
not file your response on time, 
you may lose the case by de-
fault, and your wages, money, 
and property may be taken 
without further warning from 
the court.

There are other legal re-
quirements. You may want to 
call an attorney right away. If 
you do not know an attorney, 
you may want to call an at-
torney referral service. If you 
cannot afford an attorney, you 
may be eligible for free legal 
services from a nonprofit le-
gal services program. You can 
locate these nonprofit groups 
at the California Legal Ser-
vices Web site (www.lawhelp-
california.org), the California 
Courts Online Self-Help Cen-
ter (www.courtinfo.ca.gov/
selfhelp), or by contacting 
your local court or county bar 
association. NOTE: The court 
has a statutory lien for waived 
fees and costs on any settle-
ment or arbitration award of 
$10,000 or more in a civil case. 
The court’s lien must be paid 
before the court will dismiss 
the case.

¡AVISO! Lo han deman-
dado. Si no responde dentro de 
30 días, la corte puede decidir 
en su contra sin escuchar su 
versión. Lea la información a 
continuación.

Tiene 30 DÍAS DE CAL-
ENDARIO después de que 
le entreguen esta citación y 
papeles legales para presen-
tar una repuesta por escrito 
en esta corte y hacer que se 
entregue una copia al deman-
dante. Una carta o una llamada 
telefónica no le protegen. Su 
respuesta por escrito tiene que 
estar en formato legal correcto 
si desea que procesen su caso 
en la corte. Es posible que haya 
un formulario que usted puede 
usar para su respuesta. Puede 
encontrar estos formularios 
de la corte y más información 
en el Centro de Ayuda de las 
Cortes de California (www.su-
corte.ca.gov), en la biblioteca 
de leyes de su condado o en la 
corte que le quede más cerca. 
Si no puede pagar la cuota de 
presentación, pida si secretario 
de la corte que le dé un formu-
lario de exención de pago de 
cuotas. Si no presenta su re-
spuesta a tiempo, puede perder 
el caso por incumplimiento 
y la corte le podrá quitar su 
sueldo, dinero y bienes sin más 
advertencia.

Hay otros requisitos le-
gales. Es recomendable que 
llame a un abogado inmediata-
mente. Si no conoce a un abo-
gado, puede llamar a un servi-
cio de remisión a abogados. Si 
no puede pagar a un abogado, 
es posible que cumpla con los 
requisitos para obtener ser-
vicios legales gratuitos de un 
programa de servicios lega-
les sin fines de lucro. Puede 
encontrar estos grupos sin 
fines de lucro en el sitio web 
de California Legal Services, 
(www.lawhelpcalifornia.org), 
en el Centro de Ayuda de las 
Cortes de California, (www.
sucorte.ca.gov), o poniéndose 
en contacto con la corte o el 
colegio de abogados locales. 
AVISO: Por ley, la corte tiene 
derecho a reclamar las cuotas y 
los costos exentos por imponer 
un gravamen sobre cualquier 
recuperación da $10,000 ó más 
de valor recibida mediante un 
acuerdo o una concesión de 
arbitraje en un caso de derecho 
civil. Tiene que pagar el grava-
men de la corta antes de que la 
corta pueda desechar el caso.

The name and address of 
the court is: (El nombre y la 
dirección de la corte es):

Superior Court of Califor-
nia, County of San Bernardino

247 W Third Street, San 
Bernardino California 92415 
San Bernardino District- Civil 
Division

Order for service of De-
fendant Wei Shi by publication 
made by  Stephanie Tañada, 
Judge of the Superior Court

DATE (Fecha): September 
11, 2025

Clerk (Secretario), by Ve-
ronica Gonzalez, Deputy (Ad-
junto)

The name, address and 
telephone number of plaintiff’s 
attorney, or plaintiff without an 
attorney, is: (El nombre, la di-
rección y el número de teléfono 
del abogado del demandante, o 
del demendante que no tiene 
abogado, es):

David Lawrence SBN 
210408

FitzGerald Kreditor Bold-
uc Risbrough LLP

2 Park Plaza, Suite 850,
Irvine, CA 92614
Ph. 949- 788-8900
Fax: 949-788-8980
dlawrence@fkbrlegal.com
Published in the San Ber-

nardino County Sentinel on 
October 3, 10, 17 & 24, 2025.

ORDER TO SHOW 
CAUSE FOR CHANGE 
OF NAME CASE

NUMBER CIV SB 
2526087,

TO ALL INTEREST-
ED PERSONS: Petitioner 
JUDE FRANK LIZAR-
RAGA filed with this court 
for a decree changing 
names as follows:

JUDE FRANK 
LIZARRAGA to FRANK 
JUDE LIZARRAGA, JR

THE COURT ORDERS 
that all persons interested in 
this matter appear before this 
court at the hearing indicated 
below to show cause, if any, 
why the petition for change of 
name should not be granted. 
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described above 
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter is 
scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written 
objection is timely filed, the 
court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

Notice of Hearing:
Date: 10/27/2025, Time: 

09:00 AM, Department: S36
The address of the court is 

Superior Court of California, 
County of San Bernardino, 
San Bernardino District-Civil 
Division, 247 West Third 
Street, San Bernardino, CA 
92415, IT IS FURTHER OR-
DERED that a copy of this 
order be published in the San 
Bernardino County Sentinel 
once a week for four succes-
sive weeks prior to the date set 
for hearing of the petition.

Dated: 09/15/2025
Judge of the Superior 

Court: Gilbert G. Ochoa
Published in the San Ber-

nardino County Sentinel on 
September 26 and October 3, 
10 & 17, 2025.

FBN20250009183
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

SPEEDYG CUSTOM 5868 
OSBUN ROAD SAN BERNARDI-
NO, CA 92404: SANDRA I GON-
ZALEZ

Business Mailing Address: 
5868 OSBUN ROAD SAN BER-
NARDINO, CA 92404

The business is conducted by: 
AN INDIVIDUAL

The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
above on: N/A

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/ SANDRA I GONZALEZ
Statement filed with the Coun-

ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
09/30/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy K3379

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on October 3, 
10, 17 & 24, 2025.

FBN20250008780
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

LABLIFE 15959 MOON-
FLOWER AVE CHINO, CA 91708: 
NICOLE VAUGHN

Business Mailing Address: 
P.O. BOX 350 CHINO, CA 91708

The business is conducted by: 
AN INDIVIDUAL

The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
above on: N/A

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/ NICOLE VAUGHN
Statement filed with the Coun-

ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
09/17/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy K3379

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on October 3, 
10, 17 & 24, 2025.

NOTICE OF PETI-
TION TO ADMINISTER 
ESTATE OF: GREGORY 
PAUL JOHNSON  

CASE NO. PRO-
VA2500796   

To all heirs, beneficiaries, 
creditors, contingent creditors, 
and persons who may other-
wise be interested in the will 
or estate, or both of GREGO-
RY PAUL JOHNSON: a peti-
tion for probate has been filed 
by MATTHEW JOHNSON  
in the Superior Court of Cali-
fornia, County of SAN BER-
NARDINO.

THE PETITION FOR 
PROBATE requests that MAT-
THEW JOHNSON  be ap-
pointed as personal represen-
tative to administer the estate 
of the decedent.

THE PETITION requests 
full authority to administer the 
estate under the Independent 
Administration of Estates Act. 
(This authority will allow the 
personal representative to take 
many actions without obtain-
ing court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required 
to give notice to interested per-
sons unless they have waived 
notice or consented to the pro-
posed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority 
will be granted unless an inter-
ested person files an objection 
to the petition and shows good 
cause why the court should not 
grant the authority.

A hearing on the petition 
will be held November 19, 
2025 at 9:00 a.m. at

San Bernardino County 
Superior Court Fontana Dis-
trict

Department F3 - Fontana
17780 Arrow Boulevard

Fontana, CA 92335
IF YOU OBJECT to the 

granting of the petition, you 
should appear at the hearing 
and state your objections or 
file written objections with the 
court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person 
or by your attorney.

IF YOU ARE A CREDI-
TOR or a contingent creditor 
of the decedent, you must file 
your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal 
representative appointed by 
the court within the later of ei-
ther (1) four months from the 
date of first issuance of letters 
to a general personal represen-
tative, as defined in section 
58(b) of the California Probate 
Code, or (2) 60 days from the 
date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under 
Section 9052 of the California 
Probate Code.

Other California statutes 
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a creditor. 
You may want to consult with 
an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.

YOU MAY EXAMINE 
the file kept by the court. If 
you are a person interested in 
the estate, you may file with 
the court a Request for Spe-
cial Notice (form DE-154) of 
the filing of an inventory and 
appraisal of estate assets or of 
any petition or account as pro-
vided in Probate Code section 
1250. A Request for Special 
Notice form is available from 
the court clerk.

Attorney for Matthew 
Johnson:

R. SAM PRICE SB 
208603//ROSA M. MAR-
QUEZ SB 313405

PRICE LAW FIRM, APC
454 Cajon Street
REDLANDS, CA 92373
Phone (909) 328 7000
Fax (909) 475 9500
attorneys@pricelawfirm.

com 
Published in the San Ber-

nardino County Sentinel on 
October 10, 17 & 24, 2025.

ORDER TO SHOW 
CAUSE FOR CHANGE 
OF NAME CASE

NUMBER CIV SB 
2528342

TO ALL INTEREST-
ED PERSONS: Petitioner 
EFREN MARTINEZ RO-
DRIGUEZ filed with this 
court for a decree changing 
names as follows:

 EFREN MARTINEZ 
RODRIGUEZ     to     JES-
SE EFREN MARTINEZ

THE COURT ORDERS 
that all persons interested in 
this matter appear before this 
court at the hearing indicated 
below to show cause, if any, 
why the petition for change of 
name should not be granted. 
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described above 
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter is 
scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written 
objection is timely filed, the 
court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

Notice of Hearing:
Date: November 25, 2025, 

Time: 8:35 AM, Department: 
S 27

The address of the court is 
Superior Court of California, 
County of San Bernardino, 
San Bernardino District-Civil 
Division, 247 West Third 
Street, San Bernardino, CA 
92415

IT IS FURTHER OR-
DERED that a copy of this 
order be published in the  San 
Bernardino County Sentinel, 
once a week for four succes-
sive weeks prior to the date set 
for hearing of the petition.

Dated: 10/07/2025
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Judge of the Superior 

Court: Gilbert G. Ochoa
Veronica Gonzalez, Depu-

ty Clerk of the Court
Published in the San Ber-

nardino County Sentinel on 
October 10, 17, 24 & 31, 2025.

NOTICE OF PETI-
TION TO ADMINISTER 
ESTATE OF: PATRICIA 
ANN CUNNINGTON  
CASE NO. PROVA2500770
To all heirs, beneficiaries, 
creditors, contingent creditors, 
and persons who may other-
wise be interested in the will 
or estate, or both of PATRI-
CIA ANN CUNNINGTON  
: a petition for probate has 
been filed by BELINDA 
LARSEN and KAREN VAN 
SANTEN in the Superior 
Court of California, County 
of SAN BERNARDINO. 
THE PETITION for Pro-
bate requests that BELINDA 
LARSEN and KAREN VAN 
SANTEN be appointed as per-
sonal representative to admin-
ister the estate of the decedent. 
THE PETITION requests 
authority to administer the 
estate under the Independent 
Administration of Estates Act. 
(This authority will allow the 
personal representative to take 
many actions without obtain-
ing court approval. Before 
taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal 
representative will be required 
to give notice to interested per-
sons unless they have waived 
notice or consented to the pro-
posed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority 
will be granted unless an in-
terested person files an objec-
tion to the petition and shows 
good cause why the court 
should not grant the authority. 
A hearing on the petition will 
be held November 5, 2025 at 
9:00 a.m. at:

San Bernardino County 
Superior Court Fontana Dis-
trict

Department F1 - Fontana
17780 Arrow Boulevard
Fontana, CA 92335
IF YOU OBJECT to the 

granting of the petition, you 
should appear at the hearing 
and state your objections or 
file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. 
Your appearance may be in 
person or by your attorney. 
IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR 
or a contingent creditor of 
the decedent, you must file 
your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal 
representative appointed by 
the court within the later of 
either (1) four months from 
the date of first issuance of 
letters to a general personal 
representative, as defined in 
section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days 
from the date of mailing or 
personal de-livery to you of a 
notice under Section 9052 of 
the California Probate Code. 
Other California statutes 
and legal authority may af-
fect your rights as a credi-
tor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledge-
able in California law. 
YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a 
person interested in the estate, 
you may file with the court 
a Request for Special Notice 
(form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of 
estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Pro-
bate Code section 1250. A Re-
quest for Special Notice form is 
available from the court clerk. 
Attorney for Belinda Larsen 
and Karen Van Santen:

Mathew Alden (Cali-
fornia Bar Number 288429) 
255 North D Street Suite 200 
San Bernardino, CA 92401 
(909) 414-0797 
m r a l d e n 1 2 3 @ g m a i l . c o m 
Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on October  
17, 24 & 31, 2025. 

ORDER TO SHOW 
CAUSE FOR CHANGE 
OF NAME CASE

NUMBER CIV SB 
2527555,

TO  ALL INTEREST-
ED PERSONS: Petitioner 
,Joshua David Munoz filed 
with this court for a decree 
changing names as fol-
lows: Joshua David Munoz 
to Joshua David Cambron 
Munoz, 

  THE COURT ORDERS 
that all persons interested in 
this matter appear before this 
court at the hearing indicated 
below to show cause, if any, 
why the petition for change of 
name should not be granted. 
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described above 
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter is 
scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written 
objection is timely filed, the 
court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

Notice of Hearing:
Date: 12/01/2025, Time: 

08:30 AM, Department: 
S30The address of the court is 
Superior Court of California, 
County of San Bernardino, San 
Bernardino District-Civil Di-
vision, 247 West Third Street, 
San Bernardino, CA 92415, IT 
IS FURTHER ORDERED that 
a copy of this order be pub-
lished in the  SBCS  Montclair 
in San Bernardino County 
California, once a week for 
four successive weeks prior to 
the date set for hearing of the 
petition.

Dated: 09/30/2025
Judge of the Superior 

Court: Gilbert G. Ochoa
Published in the SBCS  

on 10/10/2025, 10/17/2025, 
10/24/2025, 10/31/2025

ORDER TO SHOW 
CAUSE FOR CHANGE OF 
NAME CASE

NUMBER CIV SB 
2528389

TO ALL INTERESTED 
PERSONS: Petitioner PEDRO 
BERMUDEZ VEGA filed with 
this court for a decree chang-
ing names as follows:

PEDRO BERMUDEZ 
VEGA to PETE VEGA

THE COURT ORDERS 
that all persons interested in 
this matter appear before this 
court at the hearing indicated 
below to show cause, if any, 
why the petition for change of 
name should not be granted. 
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described above 
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter is 
scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written 
objection is timely filed, the 
court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

Notice of Hearing:
Date: November 19, 2025, 

Time: 9:00 AM, Department: 
S 36

The address of the court is 
Superior Court of California, 
County of San Bernardino, 
San Bernardino District-Civil 
Division, 247 West Third 
Street, San Bernardino, CA 
92415

IT IS FURTHER OR-
DERED that a copy of this 
order be published in the San 
Bernardino County Sentinel, 
once a week for four succes-
sive weeks prior to the date set 
for hearing of the petition.

Dated: 10/08/2025
Judge of the Superior 

Court: Gilbert G. Ochoa
Alyssia Skinner, Deputy 

Clerk of the Court

Published in the San Ber-
nardino County Sentinel on 
October 10, 17, 24 & 31, 2025.

WORKERS’ COM-
PENSATION APPEALS 
BOARD

SPECIAL NOTICE OF 
LAWSUIT

TO: Prime Staff Inc, 
Defendant, Illegally Unin-
sured Employer

Christian Banerjee, 
Applicant

WCAB NO.: 
ADJ10357952

1) A Special Notice of 
Lawsuit and Application For 
Adjudication of Claim, has 
been filed with the Workers’ 
Compensation Appeals Board 
against you as the named de-
fendant by the above named 
applicant(s). You may seek 
the advice of an attorney in 
any matter connected with 
this lawsuit and such attorney 
should be consulted promptly 
so that your response may be 
filed and entered in a timely 
fashion. If you do not know an 
attorney, you may call an at-
torney reference service or a 
legal aid office. You may also 
request assistance/information 
from an Information and As-
sistance Officer of the Division 
of Workers’ Compensation. 
(see telephone directory.)

2) An Answer to the Appli-
cation must be filed and served 
within six days of the service 
of the Application pursuant to 
Appeals Board rules; there-
fore, your written response 
must be filed with the Appeals 
Board promptly; a letter or 
phone call will not protect your 
interests.

3) You will be served with 
a Notice(s) of Hearing and 
must appear at all hearings or 
conferences. After such hear-
ing, even absent your appear-
ance, a decision may be made 
and an award of compensation 
benefits may issue against you. 
The award could result in the 
garnishment of your wages, 
taking of your money or prop-
erty, or other relief. If the Ap-
peals Board makes an award 
against you, your house or 
other dwelling or other prop-
erty may be taken to satisfy 
that award in a non-judicial 
sale, with no exemptions from 
execution. A lien may also 
be imposed upon your prop-
erty without further hearing 
and before the issuance of an 
award.

4) You must notify the 
Appeals Board of the proper 
address for the service of offi-
cial notices and papers and no-
tify the Appeals Board of any 
changes in that address.

TAKE ACTION NOW TO 
PROTECT YOUR INTER-
ESTS! Issued by: WORKERS’ 
COMPENSATION APPEALS 
BOARD

Name and Address of Ap-
peals Board: Workers’ Com-
pensation Appeals Board, 320 
W 4th St 9th Floor, Los Ange-
les CA 90013

Name and Address of Ap-
plicant’s Attorney: Ysabel 
Law, 12439 Magnolia Blvd Ste 
214, Valley Village CA 91607, 
Telephone No.: (213) 988-6033

NOTICE TO THE PER-
SON SERVED: You are 
served:  Prime Staff Inc.,

1.[X] As a corporation.
Legal documents served: 

Special Notice of Lawsuit and 
Application for Adjudication 
for claim number

Published in the SBCS 
Sentinel on 10/10/2025, 
10/17/2025, 10/24/2025,  
10/31/2025

FBN20250008987
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

FANTASY NAILS AND SPA 
SALON  255 W FRANCIS ST ON-
TARIO, CA 91762: VIVIAN LE

   Business Mailing Address:   
255 W FRANCIS ST ONTARIO, 
CA 91762

The business is conducted by: 

AN INDIVIDUAL
The registrant commenced to 

transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
above on: September 24, 2025

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/   VIVIAN LE, Owner
Statement filed with the Coun-

ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
09/24/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy J9535

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on October 10, 
17, 24 & 31, 2025.

FBN20250008380
The following entity is doing 

business primarily in San Ber-
nardino County as

SCHEMES & DREAMS  
25786 ALTO DR  SAN BER-
NARDINO, CA 92404: ALEX 
LOPEZ 

   Business Mailing Address:    
25786 ALTO DR  SAN BER-
NARDINO, CA 92404

The business is conducted by: 
AN INDIVIDUAL

The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
above on: September 8, 2025

By signing, I declare that all 
information in this statement is 
true and correct. A registrant who 
declares as true information which 
he or she knows to be false is guilty 
of a crime (B&P Code 179130). I 
am also aware that all information 
on this statement becomes Public 
Record upon filing.

/s/   ALEX LOPEZ, Owner
Statement filed with the Coun-

ty Clerk of San Bernardino on: 
09/08/2025

I hereby certify that this copy 
is a correct copy of the original 
statement on file in my office San 
Bernardino County Clerk By:/
Deputy J1808

Notice-This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed in the office of 
the county clerk. A new fictitious 
business name statement must be 
filed before that time. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state, or common law (see 
Section 14400 et seq., Business and 
Professions Code).

Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel on October 10, 
17, 24 & 31, 2025.

ORDER TO SHOW 
CAUSE FOR CHANGE 
OF NAME CASE

NUMBER CIV SB 
2528342

TO ALL INTEREST-
ED PERSONS: Petitioner 
EFREN MARTINEZ RO-
DRIGUEZ filed with this 
court for a decree changing 
names as follows:

 EFREN MARTINEZ 
RODRIGUEZ     to     JES-
SE EFREN MARTINEZ

THE COURT ORDERS 
that all persons interested in 
this matter appear before this 
court at the hearing indicated 
below to show cause, if any, 
why the petition for change of 
name should not be granted. 
Any person objecting to the 
name changes described above 
must file a written objec-
tion that includes the reasons 
for the objection at least two 
court days before the matter is 
scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written 

objection is timely filed, the 
court may grant the petition 
without a hearing.

Notice of Hearing:
Date: November 25, 2025, 

Time: 8:35 AM, Department: 
S 27

The address of the court is 
Superior Court of California, 
County of San Bernardino, 
San Bernardino District-Civil 
Division, 247 West Third 
Street, San Bernardino, CA 
92415

IT IS FURTHER OR-
DERED that a copy of this 
order be published in the  San 
Bernardino County Sentinel, 
once a week for four succes-
sive weeks prior to the date set 
for hearing of the petition.

Dated: 10/07/2025
Judge of the Superior 

Court: Gilbert G. Ochoa
Veronica Gonzalez, Depu-

ty Clerk of the Court
Published in the San Ber-

nardino County Sentinel on 
October 10, 17, 24 & 31, 2025.

FBN 20250006182     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: DAVINCI MEDICAL. 1173 
PINK DAWN CT HEMET, CA 92545;[ 
MAILING ADDRESS 1173 PINK 
DAWN CT HEMET, CA 92545]; 
COUNTY OF RIVERISDE 
DERONN L ALEXANDER  
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ DERON L ALEXANDER, OWNER 
Statement filed with the County Clerk 
of San Bernardino on: JULY 03, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 07/11/2025, 07/18/2025, 
07/25/2025, 08/01/2025          CN-
BB28202501MT CORRECTION 
DATES CORRECTION DATES 
08/08/2025, 08/15/2025, 08/22/2025, 
08/29/2025  CORRECTION DATES 
09/12/2025, 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025 & 
10/03/2025

FBN 20250007317     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: MOVING WATERS OUT 
OF THY BELLY MINISTRIES; 
MOVING WATERS HOPE 4 TO-
MORROW INC. 1191 E FOOTHILL 
BV UPLAND CA 91786;[ MAIL-
ING ADDRESS 143 WESMAN 
WAY #D UPLAND, CA 91786]; 
COUNTY OF  SAN BERNARDINO 
MOVING WATERS OUT OF THY 
BELLY MINISTRIES 143 WISE-
MAN WAY #D UPLAND CA 91786 
STATE OF INCORPORATION CA 
The business is conduct-
ed by: A CORPORATION.  
The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names 
listed above on: OCT 12, 2020 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ EMEREE PATTERSON, CEO 
Statement filed with the County Clerk of 
San Bernardino on: AUGUST 04, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 08/08/2025, 08/15/2025, 
08/22/2025, 08/29/2025          CN-
BB32202504MT CORRECTION 
DATES 09/12/2025, 09/19/2025, 
09/26/2025 & 10/03/2025

FBN 20250008567     
The following person is doing business 
as: TIRE KINGDOM. 10076 CEDAR 
AVE BLOOMINGTON, CA 92316;[ 
MAILING ADDRESS 10076 CEDAR 
AVE BLOOMINGTON, CA 92316]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
ROBERTO X ANGULO MELGOZA  
The business is conduct-

ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ ROBERTO X ANGU-
LO MELGOZA, OWNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202501MT 

FBN 20250008568     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: BLOOMINGTON TIRES 
18829 VALLEY BLVD BLOOM-
INGTON CA 92316;[ MAILING 
ADDRESS 18829 VALLEY BLVD 
BLOOMINGTON CA 92316]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
ROBERTO X ANGULO MELGOZA  
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ ROBERTO X ANGU-
LO MELGOZA, OWNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202502MT 

FBN 20250008566     
The following person is doing business 
as: ERICK’S GRADENING & LAND-
SCAPING SERVICES 1315 E HOLT 
BLVD #18 ONTARIO CA 91761;[ 
MAILING ADDRESS 1315 E HOLT 
BLVD #18 ONTARIO CA 91761]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
ERICK RAMOS BALLESTEROS  
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ ERICK RAMOS BALL-
ESTEROS, OWNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202503MT 

FBN 20250008630     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: 1602 TUOLUMNE RD 
BIG BEAR CITY CA 92314;[ 
MAILING ADDRESS P.O BOX 
2234 BIG BEAR CITY CA 92314]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
LARS T STALFORS; CHRIS-
TOPHER P MATTHEWS 
The business is conducted by: A 
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 

that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ LARS T STALFORS, 
GENERAL PARTNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 12, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202504MT 

FBN 20250008331     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: BLAQ LABEL ACQUISI-
TION; BLAQ LABEL; BLAQ INKK; 
BLAQ INC. 26210 WINDSOR DR. 
LOMA LINDA CA 92354;[ MAIL-
ING ADDRESS 26210 WINDSOR 
DR. LOMA LINDA CA 92354]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
BLAQ LABEL ACQUISI-
TION LLC 26210 WINDSOR 
DR. LOMA LINDA CA 92354  
The business is conducted by: A 
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ RAYMOND MCCALL, 
MANAGING MEMBER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 05, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202505MT 

FBN 20250008729     
The following person is doing business 
as: HIJAS DE VILLA 2671 RECHE 
CANYON RD COLTON CA 92570;[ 
MAILING ADDRESS 2671 RECHE 
CANYON RD COLTON CA 92570]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
YESENIA DIAZ; SAMUEL DIAZ  
The business is conducted by: A 
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP.  
The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names 
listed above on: APR 09, 2025 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ YESENIA DIAZ, GEN-
ERAL PARTNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 15, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202506MT 

FBN 20250008758     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: IE HAIR EXPO 464 W 
HIGHLAND SAN BERNARDI-
NO CA 92405;[ MAILING AD-
DRESS 464 W HIGHLAND 
SAN BERNARDINO CA 92405]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
LA TONYA A CARR; JA-
QUETTA GREEN 
The business is conducted by: A 
GENERAL PARTNERSHIP.  
The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names 
listed above on: SEP 01, 2025 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ LA TONYA A CARR, 
GENERAL PARTNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
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ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 16, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202507MT 

FBN 20250008902    
The following person is doing business 
as: HAUSE OF ESCROW A NON IN-
DEPENDENT BROKER ESCROW 
10803 FOOTHILL BLVD SUITE 
112 RANCHO CUCAMONGA CA 
91730;[ MAILING ADDRESS 10803 
FOOTHILL BLVD SUITE 112 RAN-
CHO CUCAMONGA CA 91730]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
HAUS OF REAL ESTATE INC 
10803 FOOTHILL BLVD SUITE 112 
RANCHO CUCAMONGA CA 91730 
STATE OF INCORPORATION CA 
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ SHPEND QERIMI, PRESIDENT 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 18, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202508MT 

FBN 20250008759    
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: BIG BRILLIANT PRO-
DUCTIONS 2294 W 6TH ST SAN 
BERNARDINO CA 92410;[ MAIL-
ING ADDRESS 2294 W 6TH ST 
SAN BERNARDINO CA 92410]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
WESTON C. LAUDER III   
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 

By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ WESTON C. LAUDER III  
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 16, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202509MT 

FBN 20250008899    
The following person is doing business 
as: EPIRE REALTY SOLUTIONS 
10803 FOOTHILL BLVD, SUITE 
112 RANCHO CUCAMONGA CA 
91730;[ MAILING ADDRESS 10803 
FOOTHILL BLVD, SUITE 112 RAN-
CHO CUCAMONGA CA 91730]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
HAUS OF REAL ESTATE, INC. 
10803 FOOTHILL BLVD, SUITE 112 
RANCHO CUCAMONGA CA 91730 
STATE OF INCORPORATION CA  
The business is conduct-
ed by: A CORPORATION.  
The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names 
listed above on: JAN 13, 2021 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ MICHAEL ALBOR-
NOZ, PRESIDENT 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 18, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202510MT 

FBN 20250008895   
The following person is doing busi-

ness as: PRECISE MOMENT 10361 
VISTA GROVE STREET RAN-
CHO CUCAMONGA CA 91737;[ 
MAILING ADDRESS 10361 
VISTA GROVE STREET RAN-
CHO CUCAMONGA CA 91737]; 
COUNTY SAN BERNARDINO 
HAUSE OF REAL ESTATE INC 
10803 FOOTHILL BLVD, SUITE 112 
RANCHO CUCAMONGA CA 91730 
STATE OF INCORPORATION CA  
The business is conduct-
ed by: A CORPORATION.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ MARTIN YANKOV, PRESIDENT 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 18, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 09/19/2025, 09/26/2025, 
10/03/2025, 10/10/2025          CN-
BB38202511MT

FBN 20250009177     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: TAQUERIA MEXICO. 711 
S EUCLID AVE ONTARIO, CA 
91762;[ MAILING ADDRESS 714 S 
EUCLID AVE ONTARIO, CA 91762]; 
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO 
TAQUERIA MEXICO LLC 711 S EU-
CLID AVE ONTARIO CA ARTICLES 
OF ORGANIZATION B20250275922 
The business is conducted by: A 
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ ANGELA GARCIA, 
MANAGING MEMBER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 29, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 

authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 10/03/2025, 10/10/2025, 
10/17/2025, 10/24/2025          CN-
BB40202501MT 

FBN 20250009122     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: L&M TRUCKING. 575 E 
JACKSON ST RIALTO, CA 92376;[ 
MAILING ADDRESS 575 E JACK-
SON ST RIALTO, CA 92376]; 
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO 
JOSE L RAMOS HERNANDEZ  
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ JOSE L RAMOS HER-
NANDEZ, OWNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 29, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 10/03/2025, 10/10/2025, 
10/17/2025, 10/24/2025          CN-
BB40202502MT 

FBN 20250009189     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: THE IMMIGRATION AND 
LAW CORPORATION. 2130 N AR-
ROWHEAD AVENUE SUITE 201A 
SAN BERNARDINO, CA 92405;[ 
MAILING ADDRESS 2130 N AR-
ROWHEAD AVENUE SUITE 201A 
SAN BERNARDINO, CA 92405]; 
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO 
U.S. IMMIGRATION & LEGAL-
IZATION CORPORATION 2130 
N ARROWHEAD AVENUE 
SUITE 201A SAN BERNARDINO 
CA 92405 STATE OF INCOR-
PORATION CA ARTICLES OF 
INCORPORATION C3582481 
The business is conduct-
ed by: A CORPORATION.  
The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names 
listed above on: JUN 06, 2013 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 

s/ OLIVIA MUSTELIER, 
CHIEF EXECUTIVE OFFICER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 30, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 10/03/2025, 10/10/2025, 
10/17/2025, 10/24/2025          CN-
BB40202503MT 

FBN 20250009166     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: SCNDVSN; SECOND DIVI-
SION 7051 ROCKSPRING LANE 
HIGHLAND, CA 92346;[ MAILING 
ADDRESS 7051 ROCKSPRING 
LANE HIGHLAND, CA 92346]; 
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO 
CAREY E. COPELAND  
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ CAREY E. COPELAND, OWNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 29, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 10/03/2025, 10/10/2025, 
10/17/2025, 10/24/2025          CN-
BB40202504MT

FBN 20250009200     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: LUCY’S BEAUTY SALON 
& BARBER; LUCY’S BEAUTY 
SALON. 715 S EUCLID AVE 
ONTARIO, CA 91762;[ MAIL-
ING ADDRESS 714 S EUCLID 
AVE ONTARIO, CA 91762]; 
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO 
LUCYS BEAUTY SALON & BAR-
BER LLC 715 S EUCLID AVE ON-
TARIO CA 91762 STATE OF OR-
GANIZATION CA ARTICLES OF 
ORGANIZATION B20250275959 

The business is conducted by: A 
LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ ANGELA GARCIA, OWNER 
Statement filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of San Bernardino 
on: SEPTEMBER 30, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 10/10/2025, 10/17/2025, 
10/24/2025, 10/31/2025          CN-
BB41202501MT 

FBN 20250009379     
The following person is doing business 
as: LILLIAN EMELY SNACK BAR. 
3378 N LAUREL AVE RIALTO, CA 
92377;[ MAILING ADDRESS 3378 N 
LAUREL AVE RIALTO, CA 92377]; 
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO 
MARIA I ENCINAS  
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ MARIA I ENCINAS, OWNER 
Statement filed with the County Clerk of 
San Bernardino on: OCTOBER 03, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardi-
no County Sentinel 10/10/2025, 
10/17/2025, 10/24/2025, 10/31/2025          
CNBB41202514003 

FBN 20250009544     
The following person is doing business 
as: TACOS SINALOA Y CARNIC-
ERIA. 17294 VALLEY BLVD SUITE 
A FONTANA, CA 92335;[ MAILING 

ADDRESS 17294 VALLEY BLVD 
SUITE A FONTANA, CA 92335]; 
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO 
MATTHEW E MEZA  
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed above on: N/A 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ MATTHEW E MEZA, OWNER 
Statement filed with the County Clerk of 
San Bernardino on: OCTOBER 08, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 10/10/2025, 10/17/2025, 
10/24/2025, 10/31/2025          CN-
BB41202504MT 

FBN 20250009379     
The following person is doing busi-
ness as: LHD MOBILE TRAILER 
REPAIR. 980 W. EVANS ST. SAN 
BERNARDINO, CA 92411;[ MAIL-
ING ADDRESS 980 W. EVANS ST. 
SAN BERNARDINO, CA 92411]; 
COUNTY OF SAN BERNARDINO 
LUIS A CERON 980 W. EVANS 
ST. SAN BERNARDINO CA 92411 
The business is conduct-
ed by: AN INDIVIDUAL.  
The registrant commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names 
listed above on: APR 05, 2010 
By signing, I declare that all infor-
mation in this statement is true and 
correct. A registrant who declares 
as true information which he or she 
knows to be false is guilty of a crime 
(B&P Code 179130. I am also aware 
that all information on this statement 
becomes Public Record upon filing. 
s/ LUIS A CERON, OWNER 
Statement filed with the County Clerk of 
San Bernardino on: OCTOBER 03, 2025 
I hereby certify that this copy is a 
correct copy of the original state-
ment on file in my office San Ber-
nardino County Clerk By:/Deputy 
Notice-This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed in the office of the county clerk. A 
new fictitious business name statement 
must be filed before that time. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state, 
or common law (see Section 14400 et 
seq., Business and Professions Code). 
Published in the San Bernardino Coun-
ty Sentinel 10/10/2025, 10/17/2025, 
10/24/2025, 10/31/2025          CN-
BB41202505MT

making sure that every 
single resident receives 
the right care at the right 
time, on time, every 
time, without exception.”

CONFIRE, Kennedy 
said, “is going to im-
prove our service deliv-
ery, establish an efficient 
system and invest both 
financial and human re-
sources back into the 
system.”

County officials rea-
soned that both CON-
FIRE and AMR per-
formed, for all intents 
and purposes, equally 
well in the evaluation of 
their proposed offerings 
of service. The deciding 
factors that tipped the 
decision in CONFIRE’s 
favor, according to the 
county, was a state law 
that encourages local 

agencies, through a fi-
nancial incentive, to de-
velop emergency medical 
transportation capabil-
ity taken together with 
San Bernardino County 
Policy 1104, which calls 
for making a determi-
nation of “best value” 
when entering into such 
contracts. Assembly Bill 
1705, passed in 2019, al-
lows an ambulance ser-
vice provider operated 
by a governmental entity 
such as the state, a coun-
ty, a city or fire protec-
tion district to receive a 
supplemental Medi-Cal 
reimbursement when 
the patient being trans-
ported is a Medi-Cal re-
cipient, this in addition 
to the  payment the pro-
vider would otherwise 
receive for that service. 

So, by contracting with 
a government-operated 
provider like CONFIRE,  
the county would be able 
to capture those supple-
mental Medi-Cal pay-
ments, whereas if the 
county contracted with 
a private sector provider 
such as AMR, it would 
not be eligible for such 
reimbursements. Thus, 
the added “value” of the 
arrangement involving 
CONFIRE dictated that 
the county contract with 
it rather than AMR, ac-
cording to county offi-
cials.

“Of the two propos-
ers that we heard today, 
CONFIRE JPA [joint 
powers authority] may 
be eligible for this fund-
ing, but only CONFIRE 
JPA,” Chairwoman of 
the Board of Supervisors 
Dawn Rowe at the De-
cember 5, 2023 meeting 
said. According to Rowe, 
the board’s decision in fa-
vor of CONFIRE hinged 

on the additional funding 
the county would receive 
by having governmental 
entities provide the am-
bulance service.

Mike Rice, who had 
said nothing during the 
December 5, 2023 meet-
ing, tore into the board 
of supervisors after its 
vote, saying the deci-
sion “does not align with 
the best interests of the 
community and … puts 
29 fewer ambulances 
a day on the road than 
what AMR proposed. 
The community and our 
hard-working employees 
will be negatively im-
pacted.” He threatened 
legal action over the 
vote.

On April 30, 2024,  
AMR made good on that 
threat, filing civil suits in 
both court and San Ber-
nardino Superior Court.

In the federal suit, 
AMR’s legal team al-
leged the county’s action 
ran afoul of the Sherman 

Antitrust Act, passed 
by the U.S. Congress in 
1890 to prohibit trusts, 
monopolies and cartels, 
promote economic fair-
ness and competition, to 
regulate interstate com-
merce and “preserve free 
and unfettered competi-
tion as the rule of trade 
for the benefit of con-
sumers.”

Judge Kenly Kiya 
Kato, as the jurist over-
seeing the federal tri-
al, dismissed the case 
against the county, rul-
ing that the federal court 
did not have proper ju-
risdiction because the 
“county defendants are 
immune from liability” 
under the Sherman Anti-
trust Act. AMR then ap-
pealed  to the 9th Circuit 
Court of Appeals.

In its decision on that 
case, the 9th Circuit pan-
el, consisting of Justices 
Callahan, Desai and De 
Alba, wrote as follows: 
“In California, prehos-

pital emergency medical 
services are governed by 
the Emergency Medi-
cal Services System and 
Prehospital Emergency 
Medical Care Personnel 
Act (“EMS Act”) [which] 
authorizes a county to 
grant emergency medi-
cal service providers the 
exclusive right to operate 
within certain geograph-
ic areas in the county 
so long as ‘a competi-
tive process is utilized 
to select the provider’ 
pursuant to a State-ap-
proved ‘local plan.’ The 
California Legislature 
intended such authori-
zation ‘to confer state 
action immunity from 
federal antitrust laws for 
actions taken by local 
government entities un-
der the EMS Act.’ While 
the Sherman Act clearly 
forbids anticompetitive 
conduct by private mar-
ket players, the Supreme 
Court in Parker v. Brown, 
Continued on Page 15
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dent Dowdy-Rodgers 
and remove her from 
the presidency, a board 
censure of McEachron 
and public apologies 
delivered during live-
streamed board meet-
ings.

Jensen’s request of 
both the district at-
torney’s office and the 
county school board are 
quixotic and decidedly 
politically unrealistic. 
Jason Anderson, since 
being elected district at-
torney in 2018, has grav-
itated into an accommo-
dation with the county’s 
political establishment, 
which includes virtually 
all elected officials in the 
county, extending to the 
members of the county 
school board and the su-
perintendent of county 
schools. While Fernan-
dez-Loof and De Leon 
are not members of the 
county school board’s 
ruling coalition, con-
sisting of Dowdy Rodg-
ers, Abernathy-Mancha 

and McEachron, which 
is aligned with Alejan-
dre, they lack the po-
litical muscle to censure 
Dowdy-Rodgers and 
McEachron, as their two 
votes would be insuf-
ficient to achieve that 
end. Moreover, to force 
a censure vote in the 
first place, a majority of 
the board would need to 
agree to conduct the cen-
sure process, which, giv-
en the current numbers 
and political orientation 
of the board, would be 
unlikely to be achieved.

This matter high-
lights ongoing tensions 
between public trans-
parency advocates and 
local government offi-
cials in San Bernardino 
County. A cross section 
of the county’s residents 
believe, and have mar-
shaled evidence to dem-
onstrate, that some elect-
ed officials have used the 
authority of their offices 
to benefit themselves, 
their family members, 
associates and politi-
cal supporters by action 
they have taken as public 
officials, including votes 
approving contracts, 
franchises and project 

proposals. The public’s 
ability to obtain public 
records has contributed 
to the exposure of such 
questionable and illegal 
activity. At the same 
time, public officials, 
such as McEachron and 
Dowdy Rodgers, have 
complained about the 
cost and administrative 
burden of responding to 
public records requests. 
California law is clear 
that such costs are part 
of the normal operations 
of government and can-
not be used as grounds 
for retaliation against 
citizens.

Debra Kamm, an ad-
vocate for children, par-
ents, free speech and 
government transparen-
cy, has conducted semi-
nars nationwide on how 
to request public records 
from government agen-
cies. After watching the 
video of the meeting, she 
sent an email to the board 
of education, addressed 
to Gwendolyn Dowdy-
Rodgers, expressing 
her concern about un-
lawful retaliation. She 
cited “Mr. McEachron’s 
threats against members 
of the public for engag-

ing in lawful activities” 
and asked, “Why is he 
so afraid of public re-
cords?”

With the assistance 
of the American Civil 
Liberties Union, Kamm 
successfully chal-
lenged the Irvine Uni-
fied School District to 
change what were ulti-
mately adjudged uncon-
stitutional board policies 
depriving the public of 
free speech rights. She 
had been threatened 
with banishment for sim-
ply stating facts that the 
school board interpreted 
as “criticism,” which the 
board policy prohibited 
in violation of the First 
Amendment.

Kamm further noted 
in her email to the board 
that the action taken by 
board members violated 
the board’s own policy 
116 Governance Stan-
dards and Ethical Con-
duct, which enumerates 
multiple standards relat-
ing to professional con-
duct, treating others with 
civility and respect, and 
supporting and protect-
ing due process and civil 
rights of all individuals, 
calling out Dowdy-Rod-

gers for not stepping in 
as president of the board 
to curb McEachron, 
whom she opined should 
have been censured for 
his comportment on 
September 8.

Kamm proposed that 
the board adopt a reso-
lution against retaliation 
and requested that the 
board ensure transpar-
ency of the costs of using 
highly paid law firms to 
respond to public records 
requests, which could 
be performed by exist-
ing staff at much lower 
cost to the taxpayer. She 

stated these actions were 
necessary to “restore 
public trust, protect con-
stitutional rights, and 
ensure that oversight is 
not chilled by unlawful 
threats or misuse of pub-
lic resources.”

The video evidence of 
the September 8, 2025 
San Bernardino Coun-
ty Board of Education 
meeting is available on 
YouTube and provides 
the primary documenta-
tion for the allegations 
outlined in the complaint 
to the district attorney’s 
office.

Continued on Page 16

rum that have plunged 
the board meetings into 
chaos. Rendler, as the 
school board president 
throughout that time, 
has labored in vain to of-
ficiate over orderly and 
dignified proceedings. 
The manner in which the 
liberal forces have alien-
ated Rendler, those on 
the now-prevailing es-
tablishment’s side say, is 
as much of a factor in the 
direction the district is 
now taking as anything 
else.

Together For Red-
lands disputed that size-
up, saying Rendler was 
never on a trajectory to 
see eye-to-eye with its 
group’s members or the 
other left-leaning resi-
dents in the city.

“It is implied that Ms. 
Rendler is solely react-
ing to the tactics used by 
Together For Redlands,” 
the group told the Senti-
nel. “In fact, Ms. Rendler 

had previously voiced 
support for banning 
books and banning flags 
during previous school 
boards, but lacked sup-
port for such positions 
until Ms. Olson and Ms. 
Rendler were elected.”

Those taking issue 
with Together For Red-
lands’ political fund-
raising efforts are on the 
wrong track, the group 

we would appreciate 
the opportunity to hear 
these questions so that 
we may provide accurate 
responses,” the group 
stated. “Together For 
Redlands has filed as a 
501(c)4 and has estab-
lished a PAC [political 
action committee]. This 
enables us to promote 
the common good and 
general welfare of the 
community as well as 
engage in political activ-
ities. Together For Red-
lands follows all laws 
and regulations.”

Under tax code regu-
lations, Section 501(c)
(3) organizations are 
not able to make contri-
butions or pass money 
through to political orga-
nizations such as candi-
date committees, politi-
cal party committees or 
political action commit-
tees.

According to Togeth-
er For Redlands, it is not 
a section 501(c)(3) orga-
nization but rather a non-
profit entity organized 
under section 501(c)4, 
which puts it at liberty 
to make contributions to 
political organizations 
described in section 527, 

to include a candidate 
committee, political par-
ty committee or a politi-
cal action committee, as 
long as long as doing so 
is not the group’s prima-
ry activity.

To those in Redlands 
on the right side of the 
political spectrum, To-
gether For Redlands is 
involved in politics – un-
derhanded and cutthroat 
politics – up to the level 
of its members’ eyeballs.

It is not the liberals in 
Redlands running afoul 
of fundraising regula-
tions, according to the 
statement by Together 
For Redlands, but the 
community’s reaction-
aries. The group refer-
enced complaints made 
to the California Fair 
Political Practices Com-
mission with regard to 
Olson’s campaign fund-
ing and spending.

The Sentinel found 
two such complaints 
from 2024. One of those 
was closed out with no 
action taken and the oth-
er showed no movement 
or processing of it by the 
Fair Political Practices 
Commission’s staff since 
it was filed on November 

12, 2024, one week after 
the November 5, 2024 
election in which Olson 
was victorious.

The greater balance of 
Together For Redlands’ 
collective hostility is fo-
cused upon Candy Ol-
son, but it has engaged 
in personal and sharp ad 
hominem attacks on Wil-
son as well. According to 
Together For Redlands, 

blithely claims, an out-
and-out Nazi.

Olson crossed the line, 
they maintain, through 
what were either her own 
postings or repostings of 
photos, doctored images, 
cartoons and the like 
which, according to the 
group, reveal her intol-
erance, her infatuation 
with totalitarian regimes 
and put her authoritarian 
mindset on display for 
all the world to see.

“As for the character-
ization of Ms. Olson, in 
particular, community 
members are responding 
to her documented social 
media activity,” Togeth-
er For Redlands stated. 
“She has posted (not 
liked, but posted) sup-
port for the KKK, Nazis, 
and memes that are anti-
LGBTQ and promote 
violence. This is in addi-
tion to the more hateful 
memes she ‘liked.’”

Despite disavowing 
the use of bullying or in-
timidation tactics against 
officeholders and deny-
ing that it or its members 
had targeted the friends, 
families, or associates 
of elected officials, in its 

Wilson “doesn’t think 
Nazi flags are hate sym-
bols,” she is a religious 
bigot who “is threatened 
by other people’s reli-
gion,” she “doesn’t be-
lieve in gay marriage” 
and she is doubly bigoted 
in that she “doesn’t want 
to follow state law on 
minority rights.”

The group’s animos-
ity toward Olson runs 
deeper. She is, the group 

said in its statement to 
the Sentinel, claiming 
it was permitted to col-
lect money through an 
adjunct political action 
committee it has set up, 
and those  which could 
be expended on election-
eering efforts or advoca-
cy with regard to politi-
cal matters.

“If there are ques-
tions about the status of 
Together For Redlands, 

Amber EasleyTrisha Keeling 

war chest from the deep-
pocketed San Manuel 
Tribe. That monetary 
incentive explains, some 
said, why Obernolte had 
so little direct knowledge 
about what the land swap 
is to entail or what its im-
pacts will be.

Obernolte’s support-

Educational Offi-
cials’ Critic Wants 
DA To Prosecute 
Efforts To Squelch 
Her  from page 6 

ers defended him as an 
honest politician who 
was above being bribed 
or influenced by money. 
At the same time, they 
conceded, as did mem-
bers of his staff, that 
there was very little sub-
stance in his statements 
with regard to House 
Resolution 3925 because 
he was, as virtually all 
members of Congress 
do from time to time, 
merely carrying legisla-
tion that he had not him-
self written which was 
intended to benefit one of 
the wealthiest landown-
ers in his district.

Redlands Left-
Right Rivals Each 
Point To The Oth-
er’s Fundraising 
Faux Pas from page 
7
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LGBTQ  Advocates 
Did Not Confine 
Their Attacks To 
Board Members  
from page 7

Olson and Wilson. I 
have knocked on doors 
and contributed to their 
campaigns. I advocate 
their positions at school 
board meetings.

Together For Red-
lands

According to Califor-
nia Secretary of State 
records, Together For 
Redlands is a California 
nonprofit mutual benefit 
corporation.

“Members join a non-
profit mutual benefit 
corporation to meet like-
minded people and work 
toward an agreed upon 
goal, such as improving 
a community, complet-
ing a project, growing 
a sport, or just sharing 
interests,” according 
to the legal Up Council 
website.

Together For Red-
lands filed a statement of 
information on January 
22, 2025, listing its offi-
cers as:

• Samantha Trad, 
chief executive officer

• Kevin C. Dockham, 
chief financial officer

• Michael Paisner, 
secretary

• Trisha Keeling, ex-
ecutive director

As a California non-
profit/mutual benefit, 
Together For Redlands 
must file annual paper-
work with the state and 
federal governments. In 
general, such nonprofits 
aren’t required to start 
listing financial infor-
mation until fundraising 
exceeds $50,000.

In its articles of incor-
poration, Together For 
Redlands offers only a 
vague clue about its pur-
pose, stating, “The spe-
cific purpose of this cor-
poration is to promote 
civic awareness.”

The California At-
torney General’s Office 
publishes “Guide for 
Charities, Best practices 
for nonprofits that oper-
ate or fundraise in Cali-
fornia.” The book is spe-
cific in parts and vague 
in others.

Such nonprofits are 
allowed to engage in 
politics, but the guide is 
unclear about what is al-
lowable.

“Examples of im-

permissible conduct 
include…engaging in 
certain prohibited po-
litical activities, such as 
participation in political 
campaigns on behalf of 
or in opposition to can-
didates for public office, 
or substantial lobbying,” 
the manual states.

Together For Red-
lands supporters have 
advocated recalling Ol-
son as well as holding 
fundraisers.

“Help us raise funds 
to take back the school 
board in 2026,” the 
group’s September 3 fli-
er asks.

As a California non-
profit mutual benefit, To-
gether For Redlands isn’t 
required to report to the 
attorney general’s char-
ity registry, which moni-
tors donations for trans-
parency and legitimacy.

I spent two weeks 
exchanging emails with 
the attorney general’s 
office and the California 
Fair Political Practice 
Commission, the charter 
for which includes the 
“impartial interpretation 
and enforcement of po-
litical campaign, lobby-
ing and conflict of inter-
est laws.” The responses 
from both agencies 
didn’t clarify Together 
For Redlands’ question-
able status and conduct 
regarding whether it is 
a nonprofit corporation 
to “promote civic aware-
ness” or whether it is a 
political organization, 
which would have more 
stringent reporting re-
quirements.

Because of Together 
For Redlands’ question-
able activities, I filed 
complaints with the at-
torney general and the 
FPPC. In addition, the 
AG website urges fil-
ers to also report their 
concerns to the IRS, the 
California Department 
of Consumer Affairs, 
and local police.

The School Board
Throughout Togeth-

er For Redlands’ pro-
longed assault on Olson, 
Wilson, and Rendler, 
the other two elected 
members, Melissa Ay-
ala-Quintero and Patty 
Holohan, played to an 
audience dominated 
with Together supports.

When her support-
ers were present, Ayala-
Quintero disputed nearly 
every board comment – 
even reaching incoher-

ent and angry ramblings. 
On April 22, Superin-
tendent Juan Cabral pro-
tected Olson by wedging 
himself between Ayala-
Quintero and Olson. He 
faced Ayala-Quintero 
during the confronta-
tion. The board censured 
Ayala-Quintero on May 
13 for her verbal and 
physical threats. The 
confrontation occurred 
during public comment, 
when the camera focus-
es on the speaker, so the 
confrontation was not 
caught on video.

Holohan’s comments 
opposing Olson and 
Wilson were brief. How-
ever, Holohan was also 
prone to hyperbole, for 
example, when she said 
the new flag policy could 
lead to student suicide.

“We’re hurting a lot 
of our students by do-
ing this, if they repre-
sent a certain flag, and 
especially our LGBTQ+ 
students,” Holohan said 
in a Redlands Commu-
nity News story. “When 
something goes wrong 
to them, you guys are 
going to get hit. When 
we have a student who 
commits suicide or at-
tempts suicide, that’s 
gonna be a lot to bear, 
and that hurts me.”

Holohan boasts how 
she’s been on the Red-
lands school board for 19 
years – an era when the 
district reaped national 
attention for having at 
least 25 sexual predators 
within 20 years, accord-
ing to the San Bernardi-
no Sun. Settlements to 
students claiming sexual 
harassment totaled more 
than $45 million, the pa-
per said.

Cyber Bullying
Tricia Keeling is the 

executive director for 
Together For Redlands. 
Amber Easley, like Keel-
ing, drops F-bombs at 
school board meetings. 
In 2024, they were “best 
friends,” according to 
San Bernardino County 
Superior Court records.

Simultaneously, they 
also launched cyber-at-
tacks and cyber bullying 
against the same person.

In October 2024, the 
target of their online ha-
rassment applied for a 
restraining order against 
the pair after their at-
tacks caused the victim 
physical trauma. In court 
records, the victim refer-
enced violations of the 

California penal codes 
relating to cyberstalking 
and cyberbullying by the 
duo.

“Trisha Keeling be-
gan contacting my hus-
band on April 6, 2024, in 
an attempt to have him 
silence me from com-
menting about an activ-
ist group she belongs to, 
the members of which 
have been targeting 
and harassing others in 
our community, includ-
ing political figures, 
business, and private 
citizens. She has not 
stopped since,” the re-
straining order applica-
tion stated.

The victim’s allega-
tion against Easley was 
similar.

“Amber Easley has 
paid to acquire personal 
and background [in-
formation] not publicly 
available,” the woman 
wrote. “She has altered 
the information and im-
ages acquired. She has 
sent and posted these 
images via public social 
media and has encour-
aged members to harass, 
talk, and threaten us.”

According to the vic-
tim’s restraining order 
request:

“Trisha Keeling’s 
persistent harassment 
threats and cyberstalk-
ing have caused condi-
tions from my disability 
to worsen, causing panic 
attacks and episodes 
of intense fear trigger-
ing physical reactions, 
affecting my ability to 
function at work and 
home.”

In her restraining 
order application, the 
victim alleged Easley’s 
attacks also impacted 
her ability to function at 
home and work.

“Amber Easley’s 
persistent harassment 
and cyberstalking of 
myself and my family 
have caused my autism 
to worsen, resulting in 
prolonged anxiety, panic 
attacks, and episodes of 
intense fear triggering 
physical reactions,” the 
woman wrote in the re-
straining order petition.

The victim went to 
Redlands police, which 
advised obtaining re-
straining orders against 
both Keeling and Easley.

Disclosure: My ex-
periences with Keeling 
lend credibility to the 
victim’s allegations. At 
school board meetings, I 

spoke in favor of the new 
flag policy. Unexpect-
edly, I was the target of 
false and doctored social 
media accompanied with 
defamatory attacks un-
related to the flag policy. 
Afterward, I submitted 
an open records request 
to the Redlands school 
board. In return, I dis-
covered a letter Keeling 
sent to the school board 
defaming me based on 
abject falsehoods unre-
lated to the flag policy.

In screenshots in-
cluded in court records, 
Easley had an Instagram 
account with 8,000 fol-
lowers named “eyeroll-
sandbloodlust.” In one 
post, Easley referred to 
the victim as, “watch-
ing a woman weaponize 
her disability as a human 
shield for (her husband) 
is big (f-word) oof.”

“Oof” is a slang term 
signifying pain, surprise 
or dismay.

Also in court records, 
Keeling feigned victim-
hood while contradict-
ing herself about engag-
ing the victim in social 
media.

“While sharing fac-
tual information which 
appears in the public 
record is not prohibited 
by California law, I un-
derstood (the victim) 
was upset, and no other 
action was taken, except 
by her,” Keeling wrote. 
“I asked her to please 
stop contacting me and 
told her it was unwel-
come harassment.”

Ultimately, both re-
straining orders reached 
the courtroom of San 
Bernardino County Su-
perior Court Judge Ron-
ald Gilbert. Judge Gil-
bert denied both.

The Sentinel agreed 
to refrain from identi-
fying the woman who 
lodged the restraining 
order requests against 
Keeling and Easley by 
name. Her husband, 
Robb McDermott, spoke 
openly about the matter, 
allowing his identity to 
be disclosed.

“They were denied 
because it was a First 
Amendment conflict,” 
Robb McDermott said. 
“The judge would have 
enforced the orders on 
both of them had there 
been physical contact, 
not just cyber.”

Easley has 17 en-
tries in San Bernardino 
County court records. 

Three involve civil ha-
rassment. In 2006,

Online records reflect 
the generalities of cases. 
To delve further into 
public records, reporters 
would need to go to the 
civil division, third floor, 
of the San Bernardino 
Justice Center, 347 West 
Third Street in San Ber-
nardino.

The case num-
ber for Keeling is 
CIVSB2430701. Easley’s 
is CIVSB2431126.

Together For Red-
lands Supporters

Keeling and Easley 
were by no means alone 
in their vulgarity at 
school board meetings. 
Many of their associ-
ates, other Together For 
Redlands members and 
like-minded support-
ers – including minors 
– screamed profanity at 
the board. Some claimed 
to be transgender.

Supporter Valerie Ta-
bor ran for the Redlands 
school board to repre-
sent the district’s Area 
5, which covers much 
of eastern Redlands and 
most of Mentone, in 
2024, ultimately losing 
to Olson by 830 votes. 
Tabor frequently attends 
school board meetings, 
advocating that the dis-
trict’s schools be more 
inclusive, and support-
ive of students, in par-
ticular those who are 
neurodiverse, LGBTQ+ 
or homeless.

Tabor’s social media 
posts raised concerns 
among some in the Red-
lands community about 
her suitability for pub-
lic office. Her Instagram 
post featured a red X 
over Rendler’s face.

“Rendler needs to 
be voted out,” Tabor’s 
meme stated. “And in 
the meantime, she needs 
to be shunned. Don’t 
acknowledge her. Don’t 
greet her. Boo her. Make 
her uncomfortable and 
unwelcome in public 
spaces. At schools. At 
church. At any events.”

On July 8, Tabor was 
removed from a meet-
ing after shouting the 
f-word, the public video 
shows. Chairwoman 
Rendler cut her micro-
phone. Tabor was es-
corted out while flipping 
her middle fingers. The 
audience applauded.

Soon after, I sent a 
video of Tabor’s ejec-
Continued on Page 16
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AMR’s Prospect 
Of Keeping County 
Ambulance Fran-
chise Comes Down 
To Lawsuit In State 
Court  from page 12

317 U.S. 341 (1943), held 
that the law ‘did not ap-
ply to anticompetitive 
restraints imposed by 
the States.’ The Supreme 
Court later explained 
that a local government 
is entitled to Parker im-
munity when its restric-
tion on competition con-
stitutes ‘an authorized 
implementation of state 
policy.’ Referred to as 
the ‘clear articulation 
test,’ the Supreme Court 
has held that ‘when a 
local governmental en-
tity acts pursuant to a 
clearly articulated and 
affirmatively expressed 
state policy to displace 
competition, it is ex-
empt from scrutiny un-
der the federal antitrust 
laws.’ AMR does not 
dispute that the EMS Act 
‘clearly articulated and 
affirmatively expressed’ 
the California Legisla-
ture’s policy to displace 
competition in the field 
of emergency medical 
services but argues that 
the county defendants 
did not act ‘pursuant to’ 
this policy when award-
ing CONFIRE the ex-
clusive contract.  For ex-
ample, AMR argues that 
the request for propos-
als required the county 
defendants to award the 
monopoly to the pro-
vider that received the 
‘highest score,’ and that 
AMR received a higher 
score than CONFIRE.  
According to AMR, this 
shows that the county 
defendants awarded the 
monopoly to their ‘polit-
ically preferred provider 
in complete disregard of 
the state-mandated com-
petitive process.’ We are 
unpersuaded [by AMR’s 
argument].”

Ultimately, the 9th 
Circuit panel denied 
AMR’s appeal and up-
held Judge Kato’s ruling.

The Sentinel’s efforts 
to reach Stephen Larson, 
the attorney representing 
AMR were unsuccess-
ful. It is unknown wheth-
er Larson and the other 
attorneys in his firm, 
including Jonathan Phil-
lips, Mehrunisa Ranjha 
and Benjamin Falstein, 
plan to appeal the 9th 

Circuit panel’s ruling to 
the U.S. Supreme Court.

U.S. Courts of Ap-
peals routinely handle 
more than 50,000 cases 
each year. Generally, 
7,000 to 8,000 of those 
decisions are appealed to 
the U.S. Supreme Court. 
On a yearly basis, the Su-
preme Court considers 
only about 100 of those 
cases. Historically, the 
Supreme Court tends to 
affirm the lower court’s 
decision in a majority of 
the cases it chooses to 

legal representatives, 
“The independent, non-
biased review commit-
tee administering the 
request for proposals 
process gave AMR’s 
proposal a higher score 
than CONFIRE’s pro-
posal based on scoring 
criteria set forth in the 
request for proposals.” 
Furthermore, they main-
tain, “[T]he board of su-
pervisors voted to award 
the contract to the los-
ing bidder, CONFIRE. 
By negotiating with and 
ultimately awarding the 
contract to an ambulance 
services provider with 
an inferior bid, the coun-
ty and its board of super-
visors acted contrary to 
the request for propos-
als and state law—and, 
consequently, outside the 
narrow confines of their 
antitrust immunity.”

According to Larson, 
Phillips, Ranjha and 
Falstein, “CONFIRE’s 
proposal should not have 
been considered to begin 
with, as it failed to fulfill 
basic minimum require-
ments mandated by the 
request for proposals.”

Among those mini-
mum requirements, ac-
cording to Larson, Phil-
lips, Ranjha and Falstein 
was that Priority Am-
bulance meet specified 
previous experience cri-
teria, including having 
continuously provided 
ambulance services for 
five of the last seven 
years while serving a 
population of 1 million.

Larson, Phillips, Ran-
jha and Falstein maintain 
that Priority’s contract 
with the City of Chandler, 
Arizona commenced in 
or about January 2022 
and thus failed to satisfy 
the durational require-
ment in the request for 
proposals. Moreover, the 
lawyers argue, the two 
municipalities in Mari-
copa County Priority did 
serve for the requisite 
amount of time, the City 
of Glendale, Arizona, 
and the City of Good-
year, Arizona, have a 
population that amounts 
to 338,000 residents – far 
less than the service area 
population of 1,000,000 
required under the re-
quest for proposals.

The attorneys arguing 
on behalf of AMR ob-
served that the “require-
ments set forth in the re-
quest for proposals were 
strict,” stipulating that 

the county had to “award 
the exclusive contract to 
the bidder with the high-
est scoring proposal [in 
the competition]” and 
that the county could not 
consider awarding the 
contract to “any provider 
whose proposal failed 
to meet the minimum 
qualifications specified 
in the request for propos-
als.” But, the attorneys 
argue, the county was 
nonetheless “willing to 
disregard this mandatory 
process in order to award 
the contract to its pre-
ordained preferred pro-
vider – CONFIRE.” In 
other words, they claim, 
“the process actually 
employed by the county 
was not truly competi-
tive at all.”

In support of this 
claim, AMR’s attorneys 
point out that although 
“[t]he independent, non-
biased review commit-
tee administering the 
request for proposals 
process gave AMR’s 
proposal a higher score 
than CONFIRE’s pro-
posal based on scoring 
criteria set forth in the 
request for proposals,” 
the county’s board of 
supervisors neverthe-
less “voted to award the 
contract to the losing 
bidder, CONFIRE.” By 
negotiating with and ul-
timately awarding the 
contract to an ambulance 
services provider with 
an inferior bid, the at-
torneys say, “the county 
and its board of super-
visors acted contrary to 
the request for propos-
als and state law—and, 
consequently, outside the 
narrow confines of their 
antitrust immunity.”

 The attorneys fur-
ther maintain that CON-
FIRE’s proposal should 
never even have been 
considered to begin with, 
since it “failed to fulfill 
basic minimum require-
ments mandated by the 
request for proposals.” 
They point out that the 
request for proposals re-
quired that CONFIRE’s 
proposed subcontrac-
tor, Priority Ambulance, 
would meet specified 
previous experience cri-
teria, including having 
continuously provided 
ambulance services for 
five of the last seven 
years while serving a 
population of 1 million. 
But this criterion was not 
met, the attorneys say, 

because Priority Am-
bulance’s contract with 
the City of Chandler, 
Arizona commenced in 
or about January 2022 
and thus failed to satisfy 
the durational require-
ment in the request for 
proposals. Moreover, the 
lawyers argue, the two 
municipalities in Mari-
copa County that Prior-
ity Ambulance did serve 
for the requisite amount 
of time—the City of 
Glendale, Arizona, and 
the City of Goodyear, 

the panel wrote: “Even 
if the county defendants 
erred in implementing 
the state-approved re-
quest for proposals and 
awarded the contract 
‘in complete disregard 
of the state-mandated 
competitive process’ as 
AMR alleges, the county 
defendants are still enti-
tled to Parker immunity.  
The Supreme Court held 
in Omni [another Sher-
man Antitrust Act case 
involving a governmen-
tal entity] that a local 
government was entitled 
to Parker immunity even 
when the nature of its 
regulation was allegedly 
substantively or proce-
durally defective.  And 
this court has similarly 
held that a local govern-
ment does not ‘forfeit’ 
Parker immunity merely 
because it imperfectly 
exercises its power under 
state law.”

And with regard to 
AMR’s claim that its pro-
posal received a superior 
score, the panel wrote: 
“While AMR received 
the highest total score, 
CONFIRE received the 
highest median score.  
The request for proposal 
does not define what the 
‘highest score’ means, 
and also provides that 
the county defendants 
will award the contract 
to the ‘highest scoring 
proposer . . . whose pro-
posal presents the great-
est value’ and that ‘best 
meets the needs of the 
county.’ Accordingly, 
even if AMR had the 
‘highest score,’ the plain 
language of the state-ap-
proved request for pro-
posals gave the county 
defendants discretion 
to award the monopoly 
to the provider whose 
proposal presented ‘the 
greatest value’ to the 
county. Moreover, the 
county defendants ar-
ticulated how CONFIRE 
presented the ‘great-
est value’ to the county, 
namely, by being eligible 
for supplemental state 
funding, by improving 
public safety through 
closer integration or co-
ordination of services, 
and by promising faster 
response times than 
AMR.  The award of the 
monopoly to CONFIRE 
was thus the ‘foresee-
able result’ of the state’s 
policy.”

hear, with reversal rates 
typically in the range of 
30 percent to 40 percent.

It thus appears that 
that AMR’s only hope 
of preventing CONFIRE 
from taking over the li-
on’s share of ambulance 
service in the county is 
to win  the case being 
heard before Judge Rob-
inson in San Bernardino 
Superior Court.

In that case, AMR’s 
attorneys are seeking to 
establish that, despite  
AMR being the “ex-
clusive ‘grandfathered’ 
ambulance provider to 
the county,” the “county 
departed from this prac-
tice  and for the first 
time published a state-
approved request for 
proposals” to solicit en-
tities interested in com-
peting for the franchise. 
According to AMR’s at-
torneys, the terms of the 
franchise competition 
meant the county was 
“required to award the 
exclusive contract to the 
bidder with the highest 
scoring proposal [in the 
competition]. Moreover, 
any provider whose pro-
posal failed to meet the 
minimum qualifications 
specified in the request 
for proposals could not 
be considered at all.”

Despite what was 
supposed be a highly 
regulated and precisely 
controlled competition, 
AMR’s legal team as-
serts the county cheated 
its client out of a fair 
competitive process for 
the contract.

According to AMR’s 

Arizona—have a popu-
lation that amounts to 
338,000 residents—far 
less than the service area 
population of 1,000,000 
required under the re-
quest for proposals.

In its decision in the 
federal case, the 9th Dis-
trict Court declined to 
exercise supplemental 
jurisdiction over AMR’s 
two state-law claims, 
leaving them for a state 
court to decide: “We note 
that the state court may 
be a more appropriate 
forum to litigate AMR’s 
challenges to the county 
defendants’ execution 
and administration of the 
request for proposals,” 
the panel wrote. An im-
portant consideration in 
the federal court’s eyes 
was the precedent set in 
the Parker v. Brown case 
which was ruled on by 
the U. S. Supreme Court 
in 1943. In that decision, 
the Supreme Court held 
that while the Sherman 
Act clearly forbids anti-
competitive conduct by 
private market players, 
the law “did not apply 
to anticompetitive re-
straints imposed by the 
states.” 

 At a September 5 
hearing in San Ber-
nardino County Superior 
Court, Judge Robinson 
said he was taking the 
9th Circuit panel’s ruling 
under submission. There 
are passages within that 
ruling that do not pres-
age well for AMR. For 
instance, with regard to 
AMR’s anti-trust claim, 
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KKK & Nazi Com-
parisons To And 
Characterizations 
Of Their Opponents 
Are Apt And Not 
Hyperbole, Red-
lands Progressives 
Insist   from page 15

tion to reporters while 
reminding them that 
they should save that 
clip in case Tabor again 
runs for office, as failed 
candidates often do. In 
my day, a former candi-
date being ejected from 
a public meeting would 
have been a newsworthy 
event in itself.

Fighting Back
In August, someone 

called Mass Resistance 
for help in opposing To-
gether For Redlands.

According to its web-
site, Mass Resistance is 
a “leading pro-family 
activist organization. 
Mass Resistance pro-
vides the information 
and guidance people 
need to confront assaults 
on the traditional family, 
school children, and the 
moral foundation of so-
ciety.”

And confront it did.
On August 6, Mass 

Resistance leader Ar-
thur Schaper brought a 
video camera to Red-
lands and confronted 
Together For Redlands 
and its supporters. In 

his six-minute video, he 
aggressively challenged 
the waiting crowd to ex-
plain their positions.

None could. Instead, 
Schaper got the usual 
treatment of “Nazis” 
along with middle fin-
gers and f-words.

Irresponsible Media
Redlands school 

meetings could have 
played out as normal 
government functions 
had reporters done their 
job.

In my reporting days, 
any group with as much 
notoriety and aggres-
siveness as Together For 
Redlands would have 
been placed under the 
media magnifying glass. 
That inspection is im-
portant because readers 
naturally grow skeptical 
and would want to know 
why one group is con-
suming so much media 
oxygen.

But the public never 
benefited from such re-
search or objectivity. In 
effect, the media gave 
Together For Redlands 
members a free pass to 

act like spoiled brats.
Their temper tan-

trums included name-
calling with impunity, 
screaming without com-
punction, threats galore 
and supposedly rational-
adults vomiting profan-
ity and flashing middle 
fingers in ways which 
would scandalize their 
grandmothers.

The media’s fawning 
coverage of Together in-
cluded defaming Olson.

In July, Together For 
Redlands – via a mole 
inside her private Ins-
tagram account – asso-
ciated Olson to an im-
age of Hitler and Jesus 
published on Spicey 
Muzzled Memes. Olson 
said she liked a humor-
ous image as part of a 
20-image carousel. The 
controversial image was 
toward the end.

In reality, Olson nev-
er saw the controversial 
image; regardless, the 
media dutifully reported 
the claim as part of a 
broadbrush smear.

A responsible editor 
would have spiked the 
story for basic fairness. 
To link any person, in-
cluding elected officials 
and public figures, to 
Hitler without direct 
evidence is irresponsible 
and lazy reporting.

Even NBC glom-
med on to the story. The 
irony, Olson said, is that 
network’s reporting was 
fairer than anything the 
local media wrote. She 
said the local media 
slants coverage against 
Awaken Redlands, 
whose members support 
Olson and Wilson.

“They do all these ar-
ticles and give mentions 
to Together For Red-
lands. They just quoted 
Together For Redlands 
line after line,” Olson 
said. “They have called 
Awaken Redlands a ‘far-
right’ group.”

Like Together For 
Redlands, Awaken Red-
lands is a California 
nonprofit/mutual ben-
efit corporation. It was 
formed in 2023. Unlike 
Together, Awaken’s pur-
pose statement provides 
specifics, delineating 
that “The specific pur-
pose of this corporation 
is to focus on preserv-
ing traditional values in 
our community, to hold 
the school district board 
members, school admin-
istrators, and city coun-
cil accountable as well 
as protecting the rights 
of teachers to keep their 
classrooms neutral and 
safe without fear of re-
percussions.”

Epilogue
Together For Red-

lands has stopped at-
tending board meetings 
en masse after repeat-
ed 3-to-2 votes, with 
Rendler, Wilson and Ol-
son prevailing and Ay-
ala-Quintero and Holo-
han dissenting, in which 
changes to district policy 
were effectuated. Those 

failed. Their profanity 
succeeded only in hard-
ening Wilson’s and Ol-
son’s resolve and push-
ing Rendler into a more 
steadfast alliance with 
them. The trio did not 
buckle.

Rendler was the swing 
vote deciding contro-
versial issues. She end-
lessly sought the middle 
ground in ways that 
needlessly prolonged 
meetings and infuriated 
supporters and oppo-
nents alike.

In retrospect, I sus-
pect Rendler eventually 
committed to votes re-
flecting her values. But 
I could see how Together 
For Redlands, because 
of its repulsive behavior, 
may have lost Render’s 
vote more than Olson 
and Wilson gained it.

Finally, narcissistic 
groups like Together 
For Redlands are more 
about dominating the 
public spotlight than the 
positions it supposedly 
supports. The recent 
absence of its members 
shows that these mem-
bers may never have 
genuinely believed in the 
issues they spewed.

John Berry is an ex-
perienced newspaper re-
porter, including nine at 
the Press-Enterprise.

statement to the Sentinel, 
Together For Redlands 
acknowledged that one 
of Wilson’s and Olson’s 
supporters had gone to 

court to get a restraining 
order against Keeling, the 
group’s executive direc-
tor, and Easley, who last 
year was a major Togeth-
er For Redlands hanger-
on and one of Keeling’s 
closest associates.

“The fact that you are 
referencing a restrain-
ing order that was not 
granted demonstrates we 
are not the ones attempt-
ing to mislead people,” 
Together For Redlands 

stated.
Keeling conveyed to 

the Sentinel that particu-
lar contretemps involved 
not hers but Easley’s ani-
mus toward the woman 
who sought the restrain-
ing order and that at this 
point she wanted to move 
herself and Together For 
Redlands beyond that 
chapter.

“Look, what that 
woman [who sought the 
restraining order] was 

portraying… I didn’t 
want to know her. I didn’t 
wish to know her. I don’t 
want to be involved. I 
want nothing to do with 
Amber, either. I have no 
relationship with Amber 
Easley anymore.”

The Sentinel’s email 
to Easley in an effort to 
get her version of events 
went unreturned.

Keeling said that a 
narrative which casts Ol-
son, Wilson and Rendler 

as the virtuous trio while 
castigating those who 
oppose them as the em-
bodiment of evil does 
not reflect reality. Nor 
did she and the rest of 
the progressive forces in 
Redlands cast the first 
stone, she maintained.

At this point, accord-
ing to Keeling, Together 
For Redlands and the 
other liberals in town 
are merely replicating 
the tactics that Olson en-

gaged in before she was 
elected and which suc-
ceeded in bringing her 
into office.

“Look at what Candy 
Olson put the former 
[ l iberal /progressive] 
board members through 
over the last three or 
four years,” Keeling 
said. “They were doxed 
and couldn’t turn around 
without her coming after 
them.”

-Mark Gutglueck

Chicago based JHL Cap-
ital Group and New York 
City-based QVT Finan-
cial and its chief execu-
tive officer, James Litin-
sky, in late 2017 became 
involved in the holding 
company controlling the 
mine property, which 
was redubbed MP Mate-
rials. By 2021, QVT, JHL 
and Litinsky emerged as 
the three primary share-
holders in MP Materials, 

such that the primary 
Chinese shareholder in 
the mine, Shenghe Re-
sources, had its interest 
in the enterprise reduced 
to 7.7 percent.

In recent years, the 
mine has again begun 
production, and is cur-
rently responsible for 
roughly 11 percent of the 
rare earth minerals being 
produced globally.

On April 4, 2025, 
China imposed export 
controls on scandium, 
yttrium, samarium, 
gadolinium, terbium, 
dysprosium and lute-

tium, causing significant 
disruption to global sup-
ply chains for industries 
reliant on those materi-
als. In a reaction to that 
move, the U.S. Defense 
Department, since re-
named the Department 
of War, in July acquired 
$400 million in MP Ma-
terials preferred stock, 
giving the Pentagon a 15 
percent stake in the com-
pany. The acquisition 
was accompanied by an 
announcement that MP 
Materials would acceler-
ate the production of rare 
earth metals and beef 

up the domestic supply 
chain, thereby reducing 
dependence on foreign 
sources.

Yesterday, October 
9, China’s Commerce 
Ministry intensified the 
measures taken in April 
by adding holmium, er-
bium, thulium, europium 
and ytterbium to the list 
of elements subject to 
export restrictions.

Foreign companies 
utilizing rare earths pro-
duced in Chinese-owned 
mines, whether those 
mines are in China or 
elsewhere, will now need 

to obtain a Chinese export 
license if the final product 
built by those compa-
nies contains one of the 
twelve rare earth materi-
als comprising more than 
0.1 percent – i.e., one one-
thousandth – of the final 
product’s value.

That action has redou-
bled the determination 
to increase production at 
the Mountain Pass Mine.

“We cannot rely on 
the Chinese Communist 
Party to power our most 
critical technologies and 
defense systems,” said 
Congressman Young 

Kim, the chairwoman of 
the House East Asia and 
Pacific Subcommittee 
whose district includes 
part of San Bernardino 
County. She called “Chi-
na’s move to restrict crit-
ical minerals supplies… 
a sucker punch to U.S. 
industries and a wake-up 
call to Washington.” She 
vowed to remain “laser 
focused on protecting 
our economy and nation-
al security by building 
secure, resilient supply 
chains that Xi Jinping 
can’t lay a finger on.”

-Mark Gutglueck

Chinese Restrictions 
Triggering Mine 
Resurgence  from 
page 3

Michelle Rendler
policy changes were 
made despite the fierce 
and vulgar opposition of 
Together For Redlands 
and their philosophical 
fellow travelers.

Now, meetings are rel-
atively placid with a few 
holdouts injecting acer-
bic comments. Meetings 
are routine and conclude 
after a few hours.

Throughout the tu-
multuous meetings, 
Together For Redlands 
and their supporters 
kept doubling down on 
one failed tactic after 
another. Their bully-
ing failed. Their threats 

The School Board’s Conservative Ruling 
Coalition Endured In The Face Of Inten-
sive Opposition From The Community’s 
Progressives & Their Allies In The Media  
from page 14


